
     

1 hklmu
umlkth
and-queen-of

abw
shba
Sheba

homw
shmoth
hearing

ha
ath
»

omw
shmo
fame-of

emlw
shlme
Solomon

Mwl
lshm
to-name-of

euei
ieue
Yahweh

abhu
uthba
and-she-is-coming

uhsnl
lnsthu
to-probe-him

. And when the queen of
Sheba heard of the fame of
Solomon concerning the
name of the LORD, she
came to prove him with
hard questions.

1

hudixb
bchiduth
in-enigmas

2 abhu
uthba
and-she-is-coming

emlwuri
irushlme
toward-Jerusalem

lixb
bchil
in-army

dbk
kbd
massive

dam
mad
very

Milmg
gmlim
camels

Miawn
nshaim
ones-bearing

Mimwb
bshmim
aromatics

bezu
uzeb
and-gold

And she came to
Jerusalem with a very great
train, with camels that bare
spices, and very much gold,
and precious stones: and
when she was come to
Solomon, she communed
with him of all that was in
her heart.

2

br
rb
much

dam
mad
very

Nbau
uabn
and-stone

erqi
iqre
precious

abhu
uthba
and-she-is-coming

la
al
to

emlw
shlme
Solomon

rbdhu
uthdbr
and-she-is-speaking

uila
aliu
to-him

ha
ath
»

lk
kl
all-of

rwa
ashr
which

eie
eie
he-was

Mo
om
with

ebbl
lbbe
heart-of-her

3 dgiu
uigd
and-he-is-telling

el
le
to-her

emlw
shlme
Solomon

ha
ath
»

lk
kl
all-of

eirbd
dbrie
matters-of-her

al
la
not

eie
eie
he-was

rbd
dbr
matter

Mlon
nolm
being-obscured

Nm
mn
from

And Solomon told her all
her questions: there was not
[any] thing hid from the
king, which he told her not.

3

Klme
emlk
the-king

rwa
ashr
which

al
la
not

dige
egid
he-told

el
le
to-her

4 arhu
uthra
and-she-is-seeing

hklm
mlkth
queen-of

abw
shba
Sheba

ha
ath
»

lk
kl
all-of

hmkx
chkmth
wisdom-of

emlw
shlme
Solomon

hibeu
uebith
and-the-house

rwa
ashr
which

enb
bne
he-built

And when the queen of
Sheba had seen all
Solomon's wisdom, and the
house that he had built,

4

5 lkamu
umakl
and-food-of

unxlw
shlchnu
table-of-him

bwumu
umushb
and-seating-of

uidbo
obdiu
servants-of-him

dmomu
umomd
and-standing-of

uhrwm
mshrthu
one-ministering-to-him

And the meat of his table,
and the sitting of his
servants, and the
attendance of his ministers,
and their apparel, and his
cupbearers, and his ascent
by which he went up unto
the house of the LORD;
there was no more spirit in
her.

5

Meiwblmu
umlbshiem
and-clothings-of-them

uiqwmu
umshqiu
and-cupbearers-of-him

uhlou
uolthu
and-ascent-offering-of-him

rwa
ashr
which

eloi
iole
he-is-offering-up

hib
bith
house-of

euei
ieue
Yahweh

alu
ula
and-not

eie
eie
he-was

eb
be
in-her

duo
oud
further

xur
ruch
spirit

6 rmahu
uthamr
and-she-is-saying

la
al
to

Klme
emlk
the-king

hma
amth
true

eie
eie
he-was

rbde
edbr
the-word

rwa
ashr
which

ihomw
shmothi
I-heard

iyrab
bartzi
in-land-of-me

lo
ol
on

Kirbd
dbrik
matters-of-you

And she said to the king, It
was a true report that I
heard in mine own land of
thy acts and of thy wisdom.

6

lou
uol
and-on

Khmkx
chkmthk
wisdom-of-you

7 alu
ula
and-not

ihnmae
eamnthi
I-believed

Mirbdl
ldbrim
to-words

do
od
until

rwa
ashr
which

ihab
bathi
I-came

eniarhu
uthraine
and-they-are-seeing

inio
oini
eyes-of-me

eneu
uene
and-behold !

al
la
not

Howbeit I believed not the
words, until I came, and
mine eyes had seen [it]:
and, behold, the half was
not told me: thy wisdom and
prosperity exceedeth the
fame which I heard.

7

dge
egd
he-was-told

il
l i
to-me

iyxe
echtzi
the-half

hpsue
eusphth
you-added

emkx
chkme
wisdom

butu
utub
and-good

la
al
to

eoumwe
eshmuoe
the-report

rwa
ashr
which

ihomw
shmothi
I-heard

8 irwa
ashri
happy

Kiwna
anshik
mortals-of-you

irwa
ashri
happy

Kidbo
obdik
servants-of-you

ela
ale
these

Midmoe
eomdim
the-ones-standing

Kinpl
lphnik
before-you

dimh
thmid
continually

Happy [are] thy men,
happy [are] these thy
servants, which stand
continually before thee,
[and] that hear thy wisdom.

8

Miomwe
eshmoim
the-ones-hearing

ha
ath
»

Khmkx
chkmthk
wisdom-of-you

9 iei
iei
he-shall-be

euei
ieue
Yahweh

Kiela
aleik
Elohim-of-you

Kurb
bruk
being-blessed

rwa
ashr
who

Ypx
chphtz
he-delights

Kb
bk
in-you

Khhl
lththk
to-give-you

lo
ol
on

ask
ksa
throne-of

Blessed be the LORD thy
God, which delighted in
thee, to set thee on the
throne of Israel: because the

9
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LORD loved Israel for ever,
therefore made he thee
king, to do judgment and
justice.

larwi
ishral
Israel

hbeab
baebth
in-to-love

euei
ieue
Yahweh

ha
ath
»

larwi
ishral
Israel

Mlol
lolm
for-eon

Kmiwiu
uishimk
and-he-is-placing-you

Klml
lmlk
to-king

huwol
loshuth
to-do

tpwm
mshpht
judgment

eqdyu
utzdqe
and-justice

10 Nhhu
uththn
and-she-is-giving

Klml
lmlk
to-king

eam
mae
hundred

Mirwou
uoshrim
and-twenty

rkk
kkr
talent-of

bez
zeb
gold

Mimwbu
ubshmim
and-aromatics

ebre
erbe
to-be-many

dam
mad
exceedingly

And she gave the king an
hundred and twenty talents
of gold, and of spices very
great store, and precious
stones: there came no more
such abundance of spices as
these which the queen of
Sheba gave to king
Solomon.

10

Nbau
uabn
and-stone

erqi
iqre
precious

al
la
not

ab
ba
he-came

Mwbk
kbshm
as-aromatic

auee
eeua
the-that

duo
oud
further

brl
lrb
to-abundance

rwa
ashr
which

enhn
nthne
she-gave

hklm
mlkth
queen-of

abw
shba
Sheba

Klml
lmlk
to-king

emlw
shlme
Solomon

11 Mgu
ugm
and-moreover

ina
ani
ship-of

Mrix
chirm
Hiram

rwa
ashr
which

awn
nsha
he-carried

bez
zeb
gold

ripuam
mauphir
from-Ophir

aibe
ebia
he-brought

ripam
maphir
from-Ophir

iyo
otzi
woods-of

And the navy also of
Hiram, that brought gold
from Ophir, brought in from
Ophir great plenty of almug
trees, and precious stones.

11

Migmla
almgim
almugs

ebre
erbe
to-be-much

dam
mad
very

Nbau
uabn
and-stone

erqi
iqre
precious

12 woiu
uiosh
and-he-is-making

Klme
emlk
the-king

ha
ath
»

iyo
otzi
woods-of

Migmlae
ealmgim
the-almugs

dosm
msod
brace

hibl
lbith
for-house-of

euei
ieue
Yahweh

hiblu
ulbith
and-for-house-of

And the king made of the
almug trees pillars for the
house of the LORD, and for
the king's house, harps also
and psalteries for singers:
there came no such almug
trees, nor were seen unto
this day.

12

Klme
emlk
the-king

hurnku
uknruth
and-harps

Milbnu
unblim
and-zithers

Mirwl
lshrim
for-singers

al
la
not

ab
ba
he-came

Nk
kn
so

iyo
otzi
woods-of

Migmla
almgim
almugs

alu
ula
and-not

earn
nrae
he-was-seen

do
od
unto

Muie
eium
the-day

eze
eze
the-this

13 Klmeu
uemlk
and-the-king

emlw
shlme
Solomon

Nhn
nthn
he-gave

hklml
lmlkth
to-queen-of

abw
shba
Sheba

ha
ath
»

lk
kl
all-of

eypx
chphtze
desire-of-her

rwa
ashr
which

elaw
shale
she-asked

dblm
mlbd
aside-from

And king Solomon gave
unto the queen of Sheba all
her desire, whatsoever she
asked, beside [that] which
Solomon gave her of his
royal bounty. So she turned
and went to her own
country, she and her
servants.

13

rwa
ashr
which

Nhn
nthn
he-gave

el
le
to-her

dik
kid
as-hand-of

Klme
emlk
the-king

emlw
shlme
Solomon

Nphu
uthphn
and-she-is-facing-about

Klhu
uthlk
and-she-is-going

eyral
lartze
to-land-of-her

aie
eia
she

eidbou
uobdie
and-servants-of-her

14 ieiu
uiei
and-he-was

lqwm
mshql
weight-of

beze
ezeb
the-gold

rwa
ashr
which

ab
ba
he-came

emlwl
lshlme
to-Solomon

enwb
bshne
in-year

hxa
achth
one

ww
shsh
six

huam
mauth
hundreds

Miww
shshim
sixty

. Now the weight of gold
that came to Solomon in
one year was six hundred
threescore and six talents of
gold,

14

wwu
ushsh
and-six

rkk
kkr
talent-of

bez
zeb
gold

15 dbl
lbd
aside

iwnam
manshi
from-mortals-of

Mirhe
ethrim
the-ones-exploring

rxsmu
umschr
and-merchandise-of

Milkre
erklim
the-ones-trading

lku
ukl
and-all-of

iklm
mlki
kings-of

Beside [that he had] of
the merchantmen, and of
the traffick of the spice
merchants, and of all the
kings of Arabia, and of the
governors of the country.

15

broe
eorb
the-Arabia

huxpu
uphchuth
and-viceroys-of

Yrae
eartz
the-land

16 woiu
uiosh
and-he-is-making

Klme
emlk
the-king

emlw
shlme
Solomon

Miham
mathim
two-hundreds

eny
tzne
targe

bez
zeb
gold

tuxw
shchut
being-ductiled

ww
shsh
six

huam
mauth
hundreds

bez
zeb
gold

And king Solomon made
two hundred targets [of]
beaten gold: six hundred
[shekels] of gold went to one

16

1Kings 10BHS  :  Transliteration  /  CHES         av



target.eloi
iole
he-is-bringing-up

lo
ol
on

enye
etzne
the-targe

hxae
eachth
the-one

17 wlwu
ushlsh
and-three

huam
mauth
hundreds

Mingm
mgnim
shields

bez
zeb
gold

tuxw
shchut
being-ductiled

hwlw
shlshth
three-of

Minm
mnim
minas

bez
zeb
gold

eloi
iole
he-is-bringing-up

lo
ol
on

Ngme
emgn
the-shield

And [he made] three
hundred shields [of] beaten
gold; three pound of gold
went to one shield: and the
king put them in the house
of the forest of Lebanon.

17

hxae
eachth
the-one

Mnhiu
uithnm
and-he-is-giving-them

Klme
emlk
the-king

hib
bith
house-of

roi
ior
wildwood-of

Nunble
elbnun
the-Lebanon

18 woiu
uiosh
and-he-is-making

Klme
emlk
the-king

ask
ksa
throne-of

Nw
shn
ivory

ludg
gdul
great

uepyiu
uitzpheu
and-he-is-overlaying-him

bez
zeb
gold

zpum
muphz
glittering

Moreover the king made
a great throne of ivory, and
overlaid i t with the best
gold.

18

19 ww
shsh
six

hulom
moluth
steps

eskl
lkse
to-throne

waru
urash
and-top

lgo
ogl
round

eskl
lkse
to-throne

uirxam
machriu
from-behind-him

hdiu
uidth
and-sides

ezm
mze
from-this

ezmu
umze
and-from-this

la
al
to

The throne had six steps,
and the top of the throne
[was] round behind: and
[there were] stays on either
side on the place of the
seat, and two lions stood
beside the stays.

19

Muqm
mqum
place-of

hbwe
eshbth
the-seat

Minwu
ushnim
and-two

huira
ariuth
lions

Midmo
omdim
ones-standing

lya
atzl
beside

hudie
eiduth
the-sides

20 Minwu
ushnim
and-two

rwo
oshr
ten

Miira
ariim
lions

Midmo
omdim
ones-standing

Mw
shm
there

lo
ol
on

ww
shsh
six

hulome
emoluth
the-steps

ezm
mze
from-this

ezmu
umze
and-from-this

al
la
not

And twelve lions stood
there on the one side and
on the other upon the six
steps: there was not the like
made in any kingdom.

20

ewon
noshe
he-was-made

Nk
kn
so

lkl
lkl
for-any-of

huklmm
mmlkuth
kingdoms

21 lku
ukl
and-all-of

ilk
kli
vessels-of

eqwm
mshqe
drinking-of

Klme
emlk
the-king

emlw
shlme
Solomon

bez
zeb
gold

lku
ukl
and-all-of

ilk
kli
vessels-of

hib
bith
house-of

roi
ior
wildwood-of

And all king Solomon's
drinking vessels [were of]
gold, and all the vessels of
the house of the forest of
Lebanon [were of] pure
gold; none [were of] silver: i t
was nothing accounted of in
the days of Solomon.

21

Nunble
elbnun
the-Lebanon

bez
zeb
gold

rugs
sgur
being-plated

Nia
ain
there -is-no

Psk
ksph
silver

al
la
not

bwxn
nchshb
being-reckoned

imib
bimi
in-days-of

emlw
shlme
Solomon

emuaml
lmaume
to-aught

22 ik
ki
that

ina
ani
ship-of

wiwrh
thrshish
Tarshish

Klml
lmlk
to-king

Mib
bim
in-sea

Mo
om
with

ina
ani
ship-of

Mrix
chirm
Hiram

hxa
achth
once

wlwl
lshlsh
to-three

Minw
shnim
years

aubh
thbua
she-is-coming

ina
ani
ship-of

For the king had at sea a
navy of Tharshish with the
navy of Hiram: once in three
years came the navy of
Tharshish, bringing gold,
and silver, ivory, and apes,
and peacocks.

22

wiwrh
thrshish
Tarshish

hawn
nshath
carrying

bez
zeb
gold

Psku
uksph
and-silver

Mibenw
shnebim
elephant-tusks

Mipqu
uqphim
and-apes

Miikhu
uthkiim
and-peacocks

23 ldgiu
uigdl
and-he-is-being-great

Klme
emlk
the-king

emlw
shlme
Solomon

lkm
mkl
from-all-of

iklm
mlki
kings-of

Yrae
eartz
the-earth

rwol
loshr
to-riches

emkxlu
ulchkme
and-to-wisdom

So king Solomon
exceeded all the kings of
the earth for riches and for
wisdom.

23

24 lku
ukl
and-all-of

Yrae
eartz
the-earth

Miwqbm
mbqshim
ones-seeking

ha
ath
»

inp
phni
faces-of

emlw
shlme
Solomon

omwl
lshmo
to-hear

ha
ath
»

uhmkx
chkmthu
wisdom-of-him

rwa
ashr
which

Nhn
nthn
he-gave

And all the earth sought
to Solomon, to hear his
wisdom, which God had put
in his heart.

24

Miela
aleim
Elohim

ublb
blbu
in-heart-of-him

25 emeu
ueme
and-they

Miabm
mbaim
ones-bringing

wia
aish
man

uhxnm
mnchthu
present-of-him

ilk
kli
articles-of

Psk
ksph
silver

ilku
ukli
and-articles-of

bez
zeb
gold

humlwu
ushlmuth
and-raiments

qwnu
unshq
and-armor

And they brought every
man his present, vessels of
silver, and vessels of gold,
and garments, and armour,
and spices, horses, and
mules, a rate year by year.

25

Mimwbu
ubshmim
and-aromatics

Misus
susim
horses

Midrpu
uphrdim
and-mules

rbd
dbr
matter-of

enw
shne
year

enwb
bshne
in-year

26 Psaiu
uiasph
and-he-is-gathering

emlw
shlme
Solomon

bkr
rkb
chariot

Miwrpu
uphrshim
and-horsemen

ieiu
uiei
and-he-is-becoming

ul
lu
to-him

Pla
alph
thousand

obrau
uarbo
and-four

And Solomon gathered
together chariots and
horsemen: and he had a
thousand and four hundred

26
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chariots, and twelve
thousand horsemen, whom
he bestowed in the cities for
chariots, and with the king
at Jerusalem.

huam
mauth
hundreds

bkr
rkb
chariot

Minwu
ushnim
and-two

rwo
oshr
ten

Pla
alph
thousand

Miwrp
phrshim
horsemen

Mxniu
uinchm
and-he-is-guiding-them

irob
bori
in-cities-of

bkre
erkb
the-chariot

Mou
uom
and-with

Klme
emlk
the-king

Mlwurib
birushlm
in-Jerusalem

27 Nhiu
uithn
and-he-is-giving

Klme
emlk
the-king

ha
ath
»

Pske
eksph
the-silver

Mlwurib
birushlm
in-Jerusalem

Minbak
kabnim
as-stones

hau
uath
and »

Mizrae
earzim
the-cedars

Nhn
nthn
he-gave

And the king made silver
[to be] in Jerusalem as
stones, and cedars made he
[to be] as the sycomore trees
that [are] in the vale, for
abundance.

27

Mimqwk
kshqmim
as-sycamore-fig-trees

rwa
ashr
which

elpwb
bshphle
in-low-foothill

brl
lrb
for-multitude

28 ayumu
umutza
and-going-forth-of

Misuse
esusim
the-horses

rwa
ashr
which

emlwl
lshlme
to-Solomon

Mirymm
mmtzrim
from-Egypt

euqmu
umque
and-fair-horse

irxs
schri
merchants-of

Klme
emlk
the-king

And Solomon had horses
brought out of Egypt, and
linen yarn: the king's
merchants received the
linen yarn at a price.

28

uxqi
iqchu
they-are-taking

euqm
mque
fair-horse

rixmb
bmchir
in-price

29 elohu
uthole
and-she-is-coming-up

ayhu
uthtza
and-she-is-going-forth

ebkrm
mrkbe
chariot

Mirymm
mmtzrim
from-Egypt

wwb
bshsh
in-six

huam
mauth
hundreds

Psk
ksph
silver

susu
usus
and-horse

And a chariot came up
and went out of Egypt for six
hundred [shekels] of silver,
and an horse for an hundred
and fifty: and so for all the
kings of the Hittites, and for
the kings of Syria, did they
bring [them] out by their
means.

29

Miwmxb
bchmshim
in-fifty

eamu
umae
and-hundred

Nku
ukn
and-so

lkl
lkl
to-all-of

iklm
mlki
kings-of

Mihxe
echthim
the-Hittites

iklmlu
ulmlki
and-to-kings-of

Mra
arm
Aram

Mdib
bidm
in-hand-of-them

uayi
itzau
they-are-bringing-forth
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