
     

1Samuel

1 ieiu
uiei
and-he-is-becoming

wia
aish
man

dxa
achd
one

Nm
mn
from

Mihmre
ermthim
the-Ramathaim

Mipuy
tzuphim
Zuphites

rem
mer
from-mountain-of

Mirpa
aphrim
Ephraim

. Now there was a certain
man of Ramathaimzophim,
of mount Ephraim, and his
name [was] Elkanah, the
son of Jeroham, the son of
Elihu, the son of Tohu, the
son of Zuph, an Ephrathite:

1

umwu
ushmu
and-name-of-him

enqla
alqne
Elkanah

Nb
bn
son-of

Mxri
irchm
Jeroham

Nb
bn
son-of

aueila
alieua
Elihu

Nb
bn
son-of

uxh
thchu
Tohu

Nb
bn
son-of

Puy
tzuph
Zuph

ihrpa
aphrthi
Ephraimite

2 ulu
ulu
and-to-him

ihw
shthi
two-of

Miwn
nshim
women

Mw
shm
name-of

hxa
achth
one

enx
chne
Hannah

Mwu
ushm
and-name-of

hinwe
eshnith
the-second

ennp
phnne
Peninnah

And he had two wives; the
name of the one [was]
Hannah, and the name of
the other Peninnah: and
Peninnah had children, but
Hannah had no children.

2

ieiu
uiei
and-he-is-becoming

ennpl
lphnne
to-Peninnah

Midli
i ldim
children

enxlu
ulchne
and-to-Hannah

Nia
ain
is-no

Midli
i ldim
children

3 elou
uole
and-he-went-up

wiae
eaish
the-man

auee
eeua
the-that

uriom
moiru
from-city-of-him

Mimim
mimim
from-days

emimi
imime
toward-days

huxhwel
leshthchuth
to-worship

xbzlu
ulzbch
and-to-sacrifice

And this man went up out
of his city yearly to worship
and to sacrifice unto the
LORD of hosts in Shiloh.
And the two sons of Eli,
Hophni and Phinehas, the
priests of the LORD, [were]
there.

3

eueil
lieue
to-Yahweh-of

huaby
tzbauth
hosts

elwb
bshle
in-Shiloh

Mwu
ushm
and-name-of

inw
shni
two-of

inb
bni
sons-of

ilo
oli
Eli

inpx
chphni
Hophni

sxnpu
uphnchs
and-Phinehas

Minek
kenim
priests

eueil
lieue
to-Yahweh

4 ieiu
uiei
and-he-is-becoming

Muie
eium
the-day

xbziu
uizbch
and-he-is-sacrificing

enqla
alqne
Elkanah

Nhnu
unthn
and-he-gives

ennpl
lphnne
to-Peninnah

uhwa
ashthu
woman-of-him

And when the time was
that Elkanah offered, he
gave to Peninnah his wife,
and to all her sons and her
daughters, portions:

4

lklu
ulkl
and-to-all-of

einb
bnie
sons-of-her

eihunbu
ubnuthie
and-daughters-of-her

hunm
mnuth
assigned-shares

5 enxlu
ulchne
and-to-Hannah

Nhi
ithn
he-is-giving

enm
mne
assigned-share

hxa
achth
one

Mipa
aphim
double-sized

ik
ki
that

ha
ath
»

enx
chne
Hannah

bea
aeb
he-loves

eueiu
uieue
and-Yahweh

But unto Hannah he gave
a worthy portion; for he
loved Hannah: but the
LORD had shut up her
womb.

5

rgs
sgr
he-closed

emxr
rchme
womb-of-her

6 ehsoku
ukosthe
and-she-vexed-her

ehry
tzrthe
distress-of-her

Mg
gm
moreover

sok
kos
vexation

rubob
bobur
in-order-to

emore
erome
to-dishearten-her

ik
ki
that

rgs
sgr
he-closed

euei
ieue
Yahweh

And her adversary also
provoked her sore, for to
make her fret, because the
LORD had shut up her
womb.

6

dob
bod
about

emxr
rchme
womb-of-her

7 Nku
ukn
and-so

ewoi
ioshe
he-is-doing

enw
shne
year

enwb
bshne
in-year

idm
mdi
as-often-as

ehlo
olthe
she-went-up

hibb
bbith
in-house-of

euei
ieue
Yahweh

Nk
kn
so

ensokh
thkosne
she-vexed-her

And [as] he did so year by
year, when she went up to
the house of the LORD, so
she provoked her; therefore
she wept, and did not eat.

7

ekbhu
uthbke
and-she-is-weeping

alu
ula
and-not

lkah
thakl
she-is-eating

8 rmaiu
uiamr
and-he-is-saying

el
le
to-her

enqla
alqne
Elkanah

ewia
aishe
man-of-her

enx
chne
Hannah

eml
lme
why ?

ikbh
thbki
you-are-weeping

emlu
ulme
and-why ?

al
la
not

Then said Elkanah her
husband to her, Hannah,
why weepest thou? and why
eatest thou not? and why is
thy heart grieved? [am] not I
better to thee than ten
sons?

8

ilkah
thakli
you-are-eating

emlu
ulme
and-why ?

ori
iro
he-is-feeling-bad

Kbbl
lbbk
heart-of-you

aule
elua
not ?

ikna
anki
I

but
tub
better

Kl
lk
to-you

erwom
moshre
from-ten

Minb
bnim
sons
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9 Mqhu
uthqm
and-she-is-rising

enx
chne
Hannah

irxa
achri
after

elka
akle
to-eat-her

elwb
bshle
in-Shiloh

irxau
uachri
and-after

ehw
shthe
to-drink

ilou
uoli
and-Eli

Neke
eken
the-priest

bwi
ishb
sitting

lo
ol
on

. So Hannah rose up after
they had eaten in Shiloh,
and after they had drunk.
Now Eli the priest sat upon
a seat by a post of the
temple of the LORD.

9

aske
eksa
the-throne

lo
ol
on

hzuzm
mzuzth
jambs-of

lkie
eikl
temple-of

euei
ieue
Yahweh

10 aieu
ueia
and-she

hrm
mrth
bitter-of

wpn
nphsh
soul

llphhu
uththphll
and-she-is-praying

lo
ol
on

euei
ieue
Yahweh

ekbu
ubke
and-to-weep

ekbh
thbke
she-is-weeping

And she [was] in
bitterness of soul, and
prayed unto the LORD, and
wept sore.

10

11 rdhu
uthdr
and-she-is-vowing

rdn
ndr
vow

rmahu
uthamr
and-she-is-saying

euei
ieue
Yahweh-of

huaby
tzbauth
hosts

Ma
am
if

ear
rae
to-see

earh
thrae
you-are-seeing

inob
boni
in-humiliation-of

And she vowed a vow,
and said, O LORD of hosts,
i f thou wilt indeed look on
the affliction of thine
handmaid, and remember
me, and not forget thine
handmaid, but wilt give
unto thine handmaid a man
child, then I will give him
unto the LORD all the days
of his life, and there shall
no razor come upon his
head.

11

Khma
amthk
maidservant-of-you

inhrkzu
uzkrthni
and-you-remember-me

alu
ula
and-not

xkwh
thshkch
you-are-forgetting

ha
ath
»

Khma
amthk
maidservant-of-you

ehhnu
unththe
and-you-give

Khmal
lamthk
to-maidservant-of-you

orz
zro
seed-of

Miwna
anshim
mortals

uihhnu
unththiu
and-I-give-him

eueil
lieue
to-Yahweh

lk
kl
all-of

imi
imi
days-of

uiix
chiiu
lives-of-him

erumu
umure
and-clipper

al
la
not

eloi
iole
he-shall-come -up

lo
ol
on

uwar
rashu
head-of-him

12 eieu
ueie
and-he-became

ik
ki
that

ehbre
erbthe
she-increased

llphel
lethphll
to-pray

inpl
lphni
before

euei
ieue
Yahweh

ilou
uoli
and-Eli

rmw
shmr
observing

ha
ath
»

eip
phie
mouth-of-her

And i t came to pass, as
she continued praying
before the LORD, that Eli
marked her mouth.

12

13 enxu
uchne
and-Hannah

aie
eia
she

hrbdm
mdbrth
speaking

lo
ol
on

ebl
lbe
heart-of-her

qr
rq
but

eihpw
shphthie
lips-of-her

huon
nouth
ones-moving

eluqu
uqule
and-voice-of-her

al
la
not

Now Hannah, she spake
in her heart; only her lips
moved, but her voice was
not heard: therefore Eli
thought she had been
drunken.

13

omwi
ishmo
he-is-being-heard

ebwxiu
uichshbe
and-he-is-reckoning-her

ilo
oli
Eli

erkwl
lshkre
to-be-drunk

14 rmaiu
uiamr
and-he-is-saying

eila
alie
to-her

ilo
oli
Eli

do
od
until

ihm
mthi
when ?

Nirkhwh
thshthkrin
you-shall-be-drunk

irise
esiri
take-away !

ha
ath
»

Knii
iink
wine-of-you

Kilom
molik
from-on-you

And Eli said unto her,
How long wilt thou be
drunken? put away thy wine
from thee.

14

15 Nohu
uthon
and-she-is-answering

enx
chne
Hannah

rmahu
uthamr
and-she-is-saying

al
la
no

inda
adni
lord-of-me

ewa
ashe
woman

hwq
qshth
hardship-of

xur
ruch
spirit

ikna
anki
I

Niiu
uiin
and-wine

And Hannah answered
and said, No, my lord, I [am]
a woman of a sorrowful
spirit: I have drunk neither
wine nor strong drink, but
have poured out my soul
before the LORD.

15

rkwu
ushkr
and-intoxicant

al
la
not

ihihw
shthithi
I-drank

Kpwau
uashphk
and-I-am-pouring-out

ha
ath
»

iwpn
nphshi
soul-of-me

inpl
lphni
before

euei
ieue
Yahweh

16 la
al
must-not-be

Nhh
ththn
you-are-giving

ha
ath
»

Khma
amthk
maidservant-of-you

inpl
lphni
before

hb
bth
daughter-of

loilb
bliol
decadence

ik
ki
that

brm
mrb
from-multitude-of

Count not thine
handmaid for a daughter of
Belial: for out of the
abundance of my complaint
and grief have I spoken
hitherto.

16

ixiw
shichi
meditation-of-me

isoku
ukosi
and-vexation-of-me

ihrbd
dbrthi
I-spoke

do
od
until

ene
ene
hither

17 Noiu
uion
and-he-is-answering

ilo
oli
Eli

rmaiu
uiamr
and-he-is-saying

ikl
lki
go !

Mulwl
lshlum
to-peace

ielau
ualei
and-Elohim-of

larwi
ishral
Israel

Nhi
ithn
he-shall-give

ha
ath
»

Then Eli answered and
said, Go in peace: and the
God of Israel grant [thee]
thy petition that thou hast
asked of him.

17

Khlw
shlthk
asking-of-you

rwa
ashr
which

hlaw
shalth
you-asked

umom
momu
from-with-him

18 rmahu
uthamr
and-she-is-saying

aymh
thmtza
she-is-finding

Khxpw
shphchthk
female-slave-of-you

Nx
chn
grace

Kiniob
boinik
in-eyes-of-you

Klhu
uthlk
and-she-is-going

ewae
eashe
the-woman

And she said, Let thine
handmaid find grace in thy
sight. So the woman went
her way, and did eat, and

18
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her countenance was no
more [sad].

ekrdl
ldrke
to-way-of-her

lkahu
uthakl
and-she-is-eating

einpu
uphnie
and-faces-of-her

al
la
not

uie
eiu
they-were

el
le
to-her

duo
oud
further

19 umkwiu
uishkmu
and-they-are-rising-early

rqbb
bbqr
in-morning

uuxhwiu
uishthchuu
and-they-are-worshiping

inpl
lphni
before

euei
ieue
Yahweh

ubwiu
uishbu
and-they-are-returning

. And they rose up in the
morning early, and
worshipped before the
LORD, and returned, and
came to their house to
Ramah: and Elkanah knew
Hannah his wife; and the
LORD remembered her.

19

uabiu
uibau
and-they-are-coming

la
al
to

Mhib
bithm
house-of-them

ehmre
ermthe
toward-the-Ramah

odiu
uido
and-he-is-knowing

enqla
alqne
Elkanah

ha
ath
»

enx
chne
Hannah

uhwa
ashthu
woman-of-him

erkziu
uizkre
and-he-is-remembering-her

euei
ieue
Yahweh

20 ieiu
uiei
and-he-is-becoming

hupqhl
lthqphuth
in-revolution-of

Mimie
eimim
the-days

rehu
uther
and-she-is-being-pregnant

enx
chne
Hannah

dlhu
uthld
and-she-is-bearing

Nb
bn
son

Wherefore i t came to
pass, when the time was
come about after Hannah
had conceived, that she
bare a son, and called his
name Samuel, [saying],
Because I have asked him
of the LORD.

20

arqhu
uthqra
and-she-is-calling

ha
ath
»

umw
shmu
name-of-him

laumw
shmual
Samuel

ik
ki
that

eueim
mieue
from-Yahweh

uihlaw
shalthiu
I-asked-him

21 loiu
uiol
and-he-is-going-up

wiae
eaish
the-man

enqla
alqne
Elkanah

lku
ukl
and-all-of

uhib
bithu
household-of-him

xbzl
lzbch
to-sacrifice

eueil
lieue
to-Yahweh

ha
ath
»

xbz
zbch
sacrifice-of

And the man Elkanah,
and all his house, went up
to offer unto the LORD the
yearly sacrifice, and his vow.

21

Mimie
eimim
the-days

hau
uath
and »

urdn
ndru
vow-of-him

22 enxu
uchne
and-Hannah

al
la
not

ehlo
olthe
she-went-up

ik
ki
that

erma
amre
she-said

ewial
laishe
to-man-of-her

do
od
until

lmgi
igml
he-is-being-weaned

rone
enor
the-lad

But Hannah went not up;
for she said unto her
husband, [I will not go up]
until the child be weaned,
and [then] I will bring him,
that he may appear before
the LORD, and there abide
for ever.

22

uihabeu
uebathiu
and-I-bring-him

earnu
unrae
and-he-appears

ha
ath
»

inp
phni
before

euei
ieue
Yahweh

bwiu
uishb
and-he-dwells

Mw
shm
there

do
od
unto

Mluo
oulm
eon

23 rmaiu
uiamr
and-he-is-saying

el
le
to-her

enqla
alqne
Elkanah

ewia
aishe
man-of-her

iwo
oshi
do !

bute
etub
the-good

Kiniob
boinik
in-eyes-of-you

ibw
shbi
sit !

do
od
until

Klmg
gmlk
to-wean-you

uha
athu
him

And Elkanah her
husband said unto her, Do
what seemeth thee good;
tarry until thou have
weaned him; only the LORD
establish his word. So the
woman abode, and gave
her son suck until she
weaned him.

23

Ka
ak
yea

Mqi
iqm
he-shall-confirm

euei
ieue
Yahweh

ha
ath
»

urbd
dbru
word-of-him

bwhu
uthshb
and-she-is-sitting

ewae
eashe
the-woman

qnihu
uthinq
and-she-is-suckling

ha
ath
»

enb
bne
son-of-her

do
od
until

elmg
gmle
to-wean-her

uha
athu
him

24 uelohu
utholeu
and-she-took-up-him

emo
ome
with-her

rwak
kashr
as-which

uhlmg
gmlthu
she-weaned-him

Mirpb
bphrim
in-young-bulls

ewlw
shlshe
three

epiau
uaiphe
and-ephah

hxa
achth
one

xmq
qmch
meal

And when she had
weaned him, she took him
up with her, with three
bullocks, and one ephah of
flour, and a bottle of wine,
and brought him unto the
house of the LORD in
Shiloh: and the child [was]
young.

24

lbnu
unbl
and-crock-of

Nii
i in
wine

ueabhu
uthbaeu
and-she-is-bringing-him

hib
bith
house-of

euei
ieue
Yahweh

ulw
shlu
Shiloh

roneu
uenor
and-the-lad

ron
nor
youth

25 utxwiu
uishchtu
and-they-are-slaying

ha
ath
»

rpe
ephr
the-young-bull

uaibiu
uibiau
and-they-are-bringing

ha
ath
»

rone
enor
the-lad

la
al
to

ilo
oli
Eli

And they slew a bullock,
and brought the child to Eli.
25

26 rmahu
uthamr
and-she-is-saying

ib
bi
o !

inda
adni
lord-of-me

ix
chi
life-of

Kwpn
nphshk
soul-of-you

inda
adni
lord-of-me

ina
ani
I

ewae
eashe
the-woman

hbyne
entzbth
the-one-standing-up

And she said, Oh my
lord, [as] thy soul liveth, my
lord, I [am] the woman that
stood by thee here, praying
unto the LORD.

26

ekmo
omke
with-you

ezb
bze
in-this

llphel
lethphll
to-pray

la
al
to

euei
ieue
Yahweh
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27 la
al
to

rone
enor
the-lad

eze
eze
the-this

ihllphe
ethphllthi
I-prayed

Nhiu
uithn
and-he-is-giving

euei
ieue
Yahweh

il
l i
to-me

ha
ath
»

ihlaw
shalthi
asking-of-me

rwa
ashr
which

ihlaw
shalthi
I-asked

For this child I prayed;
and the LORD hath given
me my petition which I
asked of him:

27

umom
momu
from-with-him

28 Mgu
ugm
and-moreover

ikna
anki
I

uehlawe
eshaltheu
I-caused-to-be-asked-him

eueil
lieue
for-Yahweh

lk
kl
all-of

Mimie
eimim
the-days

rwa
ashr
which

eie
eie
he-is

aue
eua
he

luaw
shaul
being-asked

Therefore also I have
lent him to the LORD; as
long as he liveth he shall be
lent to the LORD. And he
worshipped the LORD there.

28

eueil
lieue
for-Yahweh

uxhwiu
uishthchu
and-he-is-bowing-down

Mw
shm
there

eueil
lieue
to-Yahweh

1Samuel 1  -  1Samuel 2BHS  :  Transliteration  /  CHES         av


