
     

1 dgiu
uigd
and-he-is-being-told

bauil
liuab
to-Joab

ene
ene
behold !

Klme
emlk
the-king

ekb
bke
weeping

lbahiu
uithabl
and-he-is-mourning

lo
ol
over

Mlwba
abshlm
Absalom

. And it was told Joab,
Behold, the king weepeth
and mourneth for Absalom.

1

2 iehu
uthei
and-she-is-becoming

eowhe
ethshoe
the-salvation

Muib
bium
in-day

auee
eeua
the-that

lbal
labl
to-mourning

lkl
lkl
for-all-of

Moe
eom
the-people

ik
ki
that

omw
shmo
he-heard

And the victory that day
was [turned] into mourning
unto all the people: for the
people heard say that day
how the king was grieved for
his son.

2

Moe
eom
the-people

Muib
bium
in-day

auee
eeua
the-that

rmal
lamr
to-say

byon
notzb
he-is-grieved

Klme
emlk
the-king

lo
ol
over

unb
bnu
son-of-him

3 bnghiu
uithgnb
and-they-are-stealing-in

Moe
eom
the-people

Muib
bium
in-day

auee
eeua
the-that

aubl
lbua
to-come

rioe
eoir
the-city

rwak
kashr
as-which

bnghi
ithgnb
he-is-stealing-in

Moe
eom
the-people

And the people gat them
by stealth that day into the
city, as people being
ashamed steal away when
they flee in battle.

3

Mimlkne
enklmim
the-ones-being-confounded

Msunb
bnusm
in-to-flee-them

emxlmb
bmlchme
in-battle

4 Klmeu
uemlk
and-the-king

tal
lat
he-wrapped

ha
ath
»

uinp
phniu
faces-of-him

qoziu
uizoq
and-he-is-crying-out

Klme
emlk
the-king

luq
qul
voice

ludg
gdul
great

inb
bni
son-of-me

Mulwba
abshlum
Absalom

But the king covered his
face, and the king cried with
a loud voice, O my son
Absalom, O Absalom, my
son, my son!

4

Mulwba
abshlum
Absalom

inb
bni
son-of-me

inb
bni
son-of-me

5 abiu
uiba
and-he-is-coming

baui
iuab
Joab

la
al
to

Klme
emlk
the-king

hibe
ebith
the-house

rmaiu
uiamr
and-he-is-saying

hwbe
ebshth
you-shamed

Muie
eium
the-day

ha
ath
»

inp
phni
faces-of

lk
kl
all-of

And Joab came into the
house to the king, and said,
Thou hast shamed this day
the faces of all thy servants,
which this day have saved
thy life, and the lives of thy
sons and of thy daughters,
and the lives of thy wives,
and the lives of thy
concubines;

5

Kidbo
obdik
servants-of-you

Mitlmme
emmltim
the-ones-making-escape

ha
ath
»

Kwpn
nphshk
soul-of-you

Muie
eium
the-day

hau
uath
and »

wpn
nphsh
soul-of

Kinb
bnik
sons-of-you

Kihnbu
ubnthik
and-daughters-of-you

wpnu
unphsh
and-soul-of

Kiwn
nshik
women-of-you

wpnu
unphsh
and-soul-of

Kiwglp
phlgshik
concubines-of-you

6 ebeal
laebe
to-love

ha
ath
»

Kianw
shnaik
ones-hating-you

anwlu
ulshna
and-to-hate

ha
ath
»

Kibea
aebik
ones-loving-you

ik
ki
that

hdge
egdth
you-told

Muie
eium
the-day

ik
ki
that

Nia
ain
there -is-no

In that thou lovest thine
enemies, and hatest thy
friends. For thou hast
declared this day, that thou
regardest neither princes nor
servants: for this day I
perceive, that i f Absalom
had lived, and all we had
died this day, then i t had
pleased thee well.

6

Kl
lk
to-you

Mirw
shrim
chiefs

Midbou
uobdim
and-servants

ik
ki
that

ihodi
idothi
I-know

Muie
eium
the-day

ik
ki
that

al
la
if(?)

Mulwba
abshlum
Absalom

ix
chi
alive

unlku
uklnu
and-all-of-us

Muie
eium
the-day

Mihm
mthim
ones-dying

ik
ki
that

za
az
then

rwi
ishr
upright

Kiniob
boinik
in-eyes-of-you

7 ehou
uothe
and-now

Muq
qum
rise !

ay
tza
go-forth !

rbdu
udbr
and-speak !

lo
ol
on

bl
lb
heart-of

Kidbo
obdik
servants-of-you

ik
ki
that

eueib
bieue
in-Yahweh

ihobwn
nshbothi
I-swear

ik
ki
that

Now therefore arise, go
forth, and speak comfortably
unto thy servants: for I swear
by the LORD, i f thou go not
forth, there will not tarry one
with thee this night: and
that will be worse unto thee
than all the evil that befell
thee from thy youth until
now.

7

Knia
aink
is-no-you

ayui
iutza
going-forth

Ma
am
if

Nili
i l in
he-shall-lodge

wia
aish
man

Kha
athk
with-you

elile
elile
the-night

eoru
uroe
and-evil

Kl
lk
for-you

haz
zath
this

lkm
mkl
from-all-of

eore
eroe
the-evil

rwa
ashr
which

eab
bae
she-came

Kilo
olik
over-you

Kironm
mnorik
from-youths-of-you

do
od
until

eho
othe
now

8 Mqiu
uiqm
and-he-is-rising

Klme
emlk
the-king

bwiu
uishb
and-he-is-sitting

rowb
bshor
in-gate

lklu
ulkl
and-to-all-of

Moe
eom
the-people

udige
egidu
they-told

rmal
lamr
to-say

ene
ene
behold !

Then the king arose, and
sat in the gate. And they
told unto all the people,
saying, Behold, the king
doth sit in the gate. And all
the people came before the
king: for Israel had fled
every man to his tent.

8

Klme
emlk
the-king

bwui
iushb
sitting

rowb
bshor
in-gate

abiu
uiba
and-he-is-coming

lk
kl
all-of

Moe
eom
the-people

inpl
lphni
before

Klme
emlk
the-king

larwiu
uishral
and-Israel

sn
ns
he-fled

wia
aish
man
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uileal
laeliu
to-tents-of-him

9 ieiu
uiei
and-he-is-becoming

lk
kl
all-of

Moe
eom
the-people

Nudn
ndun
adjudicating

lkb
bkl
in-all-of

itbw
shbti
tribes-of

larwi
ishral
Israel

rmal
lamr
to-say

Klme
emlk
the-king

. And all the people were
at strife throughout all the
tribes of Israel, saying, The
king saved us out of the
hand of our enemies, and
he delivered us out of the
hand of the Philistines; and
now he is fled out of the
land for Absalom.

9

unliye
etzilnu
he-rescued-us

Pkm
mkph
from-palm-of

unibia
aibinu
enemies-of-us

aueu
ueua
and-he

untlm
mltnu
he-made-escape-us

Pkm
mkph
from-palm-of

Mihwlp
phlshthim
Philistines

ehou
uothe
and-now

xrb
brch
he-ran-away

Nm
mn
from

Yrae
eartz
the-land

lom
mol
from-on

Mulwba
abshlum
Absalom

10 Mulwbau
uabshlum
and-Absalom

rwa
ashr
whom

unxwm
mshchnu
we-anointed

unilo
olinu
over-us

hm
mth
he-died

emxlmb
bmlchme
in-battle

ehou
uothe
and-now

eml
lme
why ?

Mha
athm
you

Miwrxm
mchrshim
ones-being-silent

And Absalom, whom we
anointed over us, is dead in
battle. Now therefore why
speak ye not a word of
bringing the king back?

10

biwel
leshib
to-bring-back

ha
ath
»

Klme
emlk
the-king

11 Klmeu
uemlk
and-the-king

dud
dud
David

xlw
shlch
he-sent

la
al
to

qudy
tzduq
Zadok

lau
ual
and-to

rhiba
abithr
Abiathar

Mineke
ekenim
the-priests

rmal
lamr
to-say

urbd
dbru
speak !

la
al
to

inqz
zqni
elders-of

eduei
ieude
Judah

And king David sent to
Zadok and to Abiathar the
priests, saying, Speak unto
the elders of Judah, saying,
Why are ye the last to bring
the king back to his house?
seeing the speech of all
Israel is come to the king,
[even] to his house.

11

rmal
lamr
to-say

eml
lme
why ?

uieh
theiu
you-shall-become

Minrxa
achrnim
last-ones

biwel
leshib
to-bring-back

ha
ath
»

Klme
emlk
the-king

la
al
to

uhib
bithu
house-of-him

rbdu
udbr
and-word-of

lk
kl
all-of

larwi
ishral
Israel

ab
ba
he-came

la
al
to

Klme
emlk
the-king

la
al
to

uhib
bithu
house-of-him

12 ixa
achi
brothers-of-me

Mha
athm
you

imyo
otzmi
bone-of-me

irwbu
ubshri
and-flesh-of-me

Mha
athm
you

emlu
ulme
and-why ?

uieh
theiu
you-shall-become

Minrxa
achrnim
last-ones

Ye [are] my brethren, ye
[are] my bones and my
flesh: wherefore then are ye
the last to bring back the
king?

12

biwel
leshib
to-bring-back

ha
ath
»

Klme
emlk
the-king

13 awmolu
ulomsha
and-to-Amasa

urmh
thmru
you-shall-say

aule
elua
not ?

imyo
otzmi
bone-of-me

irwbu
ubshri
and-flesh-of-me

eha
athe
you

ek
ke
thus

ewoi
ioshe
he-shall-do

il
l i
to-me

Miela
aleim
Elohim

And say ye to Amasa,
[Art] thou not of my bone,
and of my flesh? God do so
to me, and more also, i f
thou be not captain of the
host before me continually
in the room of Joab.

13

eku
uke
and-thus

Pisui
iusiph
he-shall-add

Ma
am
if

al
la
not

rw
shr
chief-of

aby
tzba
host

eieh
theie
you-shall-become

inpl
lphni
before-me

lk
kl
all-of

Mimie
eimim
the-days

hxh
thchth
instead-of

baui
iuab
Joab

14 tiu
uit
and-he-is-declining

ha
ath
»

bbl
lbb
heart-of

lk
kl
all-of

wia
aish
man-of

eduei
ieude
Judah

wiak
kaish
as-man

dxa
achd
one

uxlwiu
uishlchu
and-they-are-sending

la
al
to

Klme
emlk
the-king

And he bowed the heart
of all the men of Judah,
even as [the heart of] one
man; so that they sent [this
word] unto the king, Return
thou, and all thy servants.

14

buw
shub
return !

eha
athe
you

lku
ukl
and-all-of

Kidbo
obdik
servants-of-you

15 bwiu
uishb
and-he-is-returning

Klme
emlk
the-king

abiu
uiba
and-he-is-coming

do
od
unto

Ndrie
eirdn
the-Jordan

edueiu
uieude
and-Judah

ab
ba
he-came

elglge
eglgle
toward-the-Gilgal

So the king returned, and
came to Jordan. And Judah
came to Gilgal, to go to
meet the king, to conduct
the king over Jordan.

15

hkll
llkth
to-go

harql
lqrath
to-meet

Klme
emlk
the-king

riboel
leobir
to-bring-across

ha
ath
»

Klme
emlk
the-king

ha
ath
»

Ndrie
eirdn
the-Jordan
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16 remiu
uimer
and-he-is-hastening

iomw
shmoi
Shimei

Nb
bn
son-of

arg
gra
Gera

Nb
bn
Ben

inimie
eimini
the-Jamite

rwa
ashr
who

Miruxbm
mbchurim
from-Bahurim

driu
uird
and-he-is-coming-down

. And Shimei the son of
Gera, a Benjamite, which
[was] of Bahurim, hasted
and came down with the
men of Judah to meet king
David.

16

Mo
om
with

wia
aish
man-of

eduei
ieude
Judah

harql
lqrath
to-meet

Klme
emlk
the-king

dud
dud
David

17 Plau
ualph
and-thousand

wia
aish
man

umo
omu
with-him

Nminbm
mbnimn
from-Benjamin

abiyu
utziba
and-Ziba

ron
nor
lad-of

hib
bith
house-of

luaw
shaul
Saul

hwmxu
uchmshth
and-five-of

rwo
oshr
ten

And [there were] a
thousand men of Benjamin
with him, and Ziba the
servant of the house of
Saul, and his fifteen sons
and his twenty servants with
him; and they went over
Jordan before the king.

17

uinb
bniu
sons-of-him

Mirwou
uoshrim
and-twenty

uidbo
obdiu
servants-of-him

uha
athu
with-him

uxlyu
utzlchu
and-they-prospered

Ndrie
eirdn
the-Jordan

inpl
lphni
before

Klme
emlk
the-king

18 erbou
uobre
and-he-crossed

erboe
eobre
the-crossing

ribol
lobir
to-bring-across

ha
ath
»

hib
bith
household-of

Klme
emlk
the-king

huwolu
uloshuth
and-to-do

bute
etub
the-good

uniob
boinu
in-eye-of-him

And there went over a
ferry boat to carry over the
king's household, and to do
what he thought good. And
Shimei the son of Gera fell
down before the king, as he
was come over Jordan;

18

iomwu
ushmoi
and-Shimei

Nb
bn
son-of

arg
gra
Gera

lpn
nphl
he-fell

inpl
lphni
before

Klme
emlk
the-king

urbob
bobru
in-to-cross-over-him

Ndrib
birdn
in-Jordan

19 rmaiu
uiamr
and-he-is-saying

la
al
to

Klme
emlk
the-king

la
al
must-not-be

bwxi
ichshb
he-is-accounting

il
l i
to-me

inda
adni
lord-of-me

Nuo
oun
depravity

lau
ual
and-must-not-be

And said unto the king,
Let not my lord impute
iniquity unto me, neither do
thou remember that which
thy servant did perversely
the day that my lord the
king went out of Jerusalem,
that the king should take i t
to his heart.

19

rkzh
thzkr
you-are-remembering

ha
ath
»

rwa
ashr
which

euoe
eoue
he-did-depravity

Kdbo
obdk
servant-of-you

Muib
bium
in-day

rwa
ashr
which

ayi
itza
he-went-forth

inda
adni
lord-of-me

Klme
emlk
the-king

Mlwurim
mirushlm
from-Jerusalem

Muwl
lshum
to-place

Klme
emlk
the-king

la
al
to

ubl
lbu
heart-of-him

20 ik
ki
that

odi
ido
he-knows

Kdbo
obdk
servant-of-you

ik
ki
that

ina
ani
I

ihatx
chtathi
I-sinned

eneu
uene
and-behold !

ihab
bathi
I-came

Muie
eium
the-day

Nuwar
rashun
first

lkl
lkl
to-all-of

hib
bith
house-of

For thy servant doth know
that I have sinned:
therefore, behold, I am
come the first this day of all
the house of Joseph to go
down to meet my lord the
king.

20

Psui
iusph
Joseph

hdrl
lrdth
to-go-down

harql
lqrath
to-meet

inda
adni
lord-of-me

Klme
emlk
the-king

21 Noiu
uion
and-he-is-responding

iwiba
abishi
Abishai

Nb
bn
son-of

eiury
tzruie
Zeruiah

rmaiu
uiamr
and-he-is-saying

hxhe
ethchth
under ?

haz
zath
this

al
la
not

hmui
iumth
he-shall-be-put-to-death

But Abishai the son of
Zeruiah answered and said,
Shall not Shimei be put to
death for this, because he
cursed the LORD'S
anointed?

21

iomw
shmoi
Shimei

ik
ki
that

llq
qll
he-slighted

ha
ath
»

xiwm
mshich
anointed-one-of

euei
ieue
Yahweh

22 rmaiu
uiamr
and-he-is-saying

dud
dud
David

em
me
what ?

il
l i
to-me

Mklu
ulkm
and-to-you

inb
bni
sons-of

eiury
tzruie
Zeruiah

ik
ki
that

uieh
theiu
you-are-becoming

il
l i
to-me

Muie
eium
the-day

And David said, What
have I to do with you, ye
sons of Zeruiah, that ye
should this day be
adversaries unto me? shall
there any man be put to
death this day in Israel? for
do not I know that I [am] this
day king over Israel?

22

Ntwl
lshtn
to-adversary

Muie
eium
the-day

hmui
iumth
he-shall-be-put-to-death

wia
aish
man

larwib
bishral
in-Israel

ik
ki
that

aule
elua
not ?

ihodi
idothi
I-know

ik
ki
that

Muie
eium
the-day

ina
ani
I

Klm
mlk
king

lo
ol
over

larwi
ishral
Israel

23 rmaiu
uiamr
and-he-is-saying

Klme
emlk
the-king

la
al
to

iomw
shmoi
Shimei

al
la
not

humh
thmuth
you-shall-die

obwiu
uishbo
and-he-is-swearing

ul
lu
to-him

Klme
emlk
the-king

Therefore the king said
unto Shimei, Thou shalt not
die. And the king sware unto
him.

23

24 hwbpmu
umphbshth
and-Mephibosheth

Nb
bn
son-of

luaw
shaul
Saul

dri
ird
he-came -down

harql
lqrath
to-meet

Klme
emlk
the-king

alu
ula
and-not

ewo
oshe
he-did

uilgr
rgliu
feet-of-him

alu
ula
and-not

. And Mephibosheth the
son of Saul came down to
meet the king, and had
neither dressed his feet, nor

24
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trimmed his beard, nor
washed his clothes, from the
day the king departed until
the day he came [again] in
peace.

ewo
oshe
he-did

umpw
shphmu
upper-lip-of-him

hau
uath
and »

uidgb
bgdiu
clothes-of-him

al
la
not

sbk
kbs
he-laundered

Nml
lmn
to-from

Muie
eium
the-day

hkl
lkth
to-go

Klme
emlk
the-king

do
od
until

Muie
eium
the-day

rwa
ashr
which

ab
ba
he-came

Mulwb
bshlum
in-peace

25 ieiu
uiei
and-he-is-becoming

ik
ki
that

ab
ba
he-came

Mlwuri
irushlm
Jerusalem

harql
lqrath
to-meet

Klme
emlk
the-king

rmaiu
uiamr
and-he-is-saying

ul
lu
to-him

Klme
emlk
the-king

eml
lme
why ?

And it came to pass,
when he was come to
Jerusalem to meet the king,
that the king said unto him,
Wherefore wentest not thou
with me, Mephibosheth?

25

al
la
not

hkle
elkth
you-went

imo
omi
with-me

hwbipm
mphibshth
Mephibosheth

26 rmaiu
uiamr
and-he-is-saying

inda
adni
lord-of-me

Klme
emlk
the-king

idbo
obdi
servant-of-me

inmr
rmni
he-deceived-me

ik
ki
that

rma
amr
he-said

Kdbo
obdk
servant-of-you

And he answered, My
lord, O king, my servant
deceived me: for thy servant
said, I will saddle me an
ass, that I may ride thereon,
and go to the king; because
thy servant [is] lame.

26

ewbxa
achbshe
I-shall-saddle

il
l i
for-me

rumxe
echmur
the-donkey

bkrau
uarkb
and-I-shall-ride

eilo
olie
on-her

Klau
ualk
and-I-shall-go

ha
ath
with

Klme
emlk
the-king

ik
ki
that

xsp
phsch
lame

Kdbo
obdk
servant-of-you

27 lgriu
uirgl
and-he-is-spying

Kdbob
bobdk
in-servant-of-you

la
al
to

inda
adni
lord-of-me

Klme
emlk
the-king

indau
uadni
and-lord-of-me

Klme
emlk
the-king

Kalmk
kmlak
as-messenger-of

And he hath slandered
thy servant unto my lord the
king; but my lord the king
[is] as an angel of God: do
therefore [what is] good in
thine eyes.

27

Mielae
ealeim
the-Elohim

ewou
uoshe
and-do !

bute
etub
the-good

Kiniob
boinik
in-eyes-of-you

28 ik
ki
that

al
la
not

eie
eie
he-was

lk
kl
any-of

hib
bith
house-of

iba
abi
father-of-me

ik
ki
except

Ma
am
only

iwna
anshi
mortals-of

hum
muth
death

indal
ladni
to-lord-of-me

Klme
emlk
the-king

For all [of] my father's
house were but dead men
before my lord the king: yet
didst thou set thy servant
among them that did eat at
thine own table. What right
therefore have I yet to cry
any more unto the king?

28

hwhu
uthshth
and-you-are-setting

ha
ath
»

Kdbo
obdk
servant-of-you

ilkab
bakli
in-ones-eating-of

Knxlw
shlchnk
table-of-you

emu
ume
and-what ?

wi
ish
forsooth

il
l i
to-me

duo
oud
further

eqdy
tzdqe
righteousness

qozlu
ulzoq
and-to-cry-out

duo
oud
further

la
al
to

Klme
emlk
the-king

29 rmaiu
uiamr
and-he-is-saying

ul
lu
to-him

Klme
emlk
the-king

eml
lme
why ?

rbdh
thdbr
you-shall-speak

duo
oud
further

Kirbd
dbrik
words-of-you

ihrma
amrthi
I-say

eha
athe
you

abiyu
utziba
and-Ziba

And the king said unto
him, Why speakest thou any
more of thy matters? I have
said, Thou and Ziba divide
the land.

29

uqlxh
thchlqu
you-shall-apportion

ha
ath
»

edwe
eshde
the-field

30 rmaiu
uiamr
and-he-is-saying

hwbipm
mphibshth
Mephibosheth

la
al
to

Klme
emlk
the-king

Mg
gm
moreover

ha
ath
»

lke
ekl
the-all

xqi
iqch
he-shall-take

irxa
achri
after

rwa
ashr
which

ab
ba
he-came

And Mephibosheth said
unto the king, Yea, let him
take all, forasmuch as my
lord the king is come again
in peace unto his own
house.

30

inda
adni
lord-of-me

Klme
emlk
the-king

Mulwb
bshlum
in-peace

la
al
to

uhib
bithu
house-of-him

31 ilzrbu
ubrzli
and-Barzillai

idolge
eglodi
the-Gileadite

dri
ird
he-came -down

Milgrm
mrglim
from-Rogelim

rboiu
uiobr
and-he-is-passing

ha
ath
with

Klme
emlk
the-king

Ndrie
eirdn
the-Jordan

. And Barzillai the
Gileadite came down from
Rogelim, and went over
Jordan with the king, to
conduct him over Jordan.

31

uxlwl
lshlchu
to-send-away-him

ha
ath
»

Ndrib
birdn
in-Jordan
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32 ilzrbu
ubrzli
and-Barzillai

Nqz
zqn
he-was-old

dam
mad
very

Nb
bn
son-of

Minmw
shmnim
eighty

enw
shne
year

aueu
ueua
and-he

lklk
klkl
he-sustained

ha
ath
»

Klme
emlk
the-king

uhbiwb
bshibthu
in-sitting-of-him

Now Barzillai was a very
aged man, [even] fourscore
years old: and he had
provided the king of
sustenance while he lay at
Mahanaim; for he [was] a
very great man.

32

Minxmb
bmchnim
in-Mahanaim

ik
ki
that

wia
aish
man

ludg
gdul
great

aue
eua
he

dam
mad
very

33 rmaiu
uiamr
and-he-is-saying

Klme
emlk
the-king

la
al
to

ilzrb
brzli
Barzillai

eha
athe
you

rbo
obr
cross-over !

iha
athi
with-me

ihlklku
uklklthi
and-I-sustain

Kha
athk
you

idmo
omdi
with-me

And the king said unto
Barzillai, Come thou over
with me, and I will feed
thee with me in Jerusalem.

33

Mlwurib
birushlm
in-Jerusalem

34 rmaiu
uiamr
and-he-is-saying

ilzrb
brzli
Barzillai

la
al
to

Klme
emlk
the-king

emk
kme
as-what ?

imi
imi
days-of

inw
shni
years-of

iix
chii
lives-of-me

ik
ki
that

eloa
aole
I-shall-go-up

ha
ath
with

And Barzillai said unto
the king, How long have I to
live, that I should go up with
the king unto Jerusalem?

34

Klme
emlk
the-king

Mlwuri
irushlm
Jerusalem

35 Nb
bn
son-of

Minmw
shmnim
eighty

enw
shne
year

ikna
anki
I

Muie
eium
the-day

odae
eado
I-shall-know ?

Nib
bin
between

but
tub
good

orl
lro
to-bad

Ma
am
if

Moti
itom
he-is-tasting

Kdbo
obdk
servant-of-you

I [am] this day fourscore
years old: [and] can I
discern between good and
evil? can thy servant taste
what I eat or what I drink?
can I hear any more the
voice of singing men and
singing women? wherefore
then should thy servant be
yet a burden unto my lord
the king?

35

ha
ath
»

rwa
ashr
which

lka
akl
I-am-eating

hau
uath
and »

rwa
ashr
which

ehwa
ashthe
I-am-drinking

Ma
am
if

omwa
ashmo
I-am-hearing

duo
oud
still

luqb
bqul
in-voice-of

Mirw
shrim
men-singing

hurwu
ushruth
and-women-singing

emlu
ulme
and-why ?

eiei
ieie
he-shall-become

Kdbo
obdk
servant-of-you

duo
oud
further

awml
lmsha
to-load

la
al
to

inda
adni
lord-of-me

Klme
emlk
the-king

36 tomk
kmot
as-little

rboi
iobr
he-shall-cross

Kdbo
obdk
servant-of-you

ha
ath
»

Ndrie
eirdn
the-Jordan

ha
ath
with

Klme
emlk
the-king

emlu
ulme
and-why ?

inlmgi
igmlni
he-shall-requite-me

Thy servant will go a
little way over Jordan with
the king: and why should
the king recompense i t me
with such a reward?

36

Klme
emlk
the-king

elumge
egmule
the-requital

haze
ezath
the-this

37 bwi
ishb
he-shall-return

an
na
please !

Kdbo
obdk
servant-of-you

hmau
uamth
and-I-shall-die

iriob
boiri
in-city-of-me

Mo
om
with

rbq
qbr
tomb-of

iba
abi
father-of-me

Let thy servant, I pray
thee, turn back again, that I
may die in mine own city,
[and be buried] by the grave
of my father and of my
mother. But behold thy
servant Chimham; let him
go over with my lord the
king; and do to him what
shall seem good unto thee.

37

imau
uami
and-mother-of-me

eneu
uene
and-behold !

Kdbo
obdk
servant-of-you

Memk
kmem
Chimham

rboi
iobr
he-shall-cross-over

Mo
om
with

inda
adni
lord-of-me

Klme
emlk
the-king

ewou
uoshe
and-do !

ul
lu
to-him

ha
ath
»

rwa
ashr
which

but
tub
good

Kiniob
boinik
in-eyes-of-you

38 rmaiu
uiamr
and-he-is-saying

Klme
emlk
the-king

iha
athi
with-me

rboi
iobr
he-shall-cross-over

Memk
kmem
Chimham

inau
uani
and-I

ewoa
aoshe
I-shall-do

ul
lu
for-him

ha
ath
»

bute
etub
the-good

And the king answered,
Chimham shall go over with
me, and I will do to him that
which shall seem good unto
thee: and whatsoever thou
shalt require of me, [that]
will I do for thee.

38

Kiniob
boinik
in-eyes-of-you

lku
ukl
and-all

rwa
ashr
which

rxbh
thbchr
you-are-choosing

ilo
oli
on-me

ewoa
aoshe
I-shall-do

Kl
lk
for-you

39 rboiu
uiobr
and-he-is-crossing

lk
kl
all-of

Moe
eom
the-people

ha
ath
»

Ndrie
eirdn
the-Jordan

Klmeu
uemlk
and-the-king

rbo
obr
he-crossed

qwiu
uishq
and-he-is-kissing

Klme
emlk
the-king

And all the people went
over Jordan. And when the
king was come over, the
king kissed Barzillai, and
blessed him; and he
returned unto his own place.

39

ilzrbl
lbrzli
to-Barzillai

uekrbiu
uibrkeu
and-he-is-blessing-him

bwiu
uishb
and-he-is-returning

umqml
lmqmu
to-place-of-him
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40 rboiu
uiobr
and-he-is-crossing

Klme
emlk
the-king

elglge
eglgle
toward-the-Gilgal

Nemku
ukmen
and-Chimham

rbo
obr
he-crossed

umo
omu
with-him

lku
ukl
and-all-of

Mo
om
people-of

. Then the king went on
to Gilgal, and Chimham
went on with him: and all
the people of Judah
conducted the king, and
also half the people of
Israel.

40

eduei
ieude
Judah

urboiu
uiobru
and-they-are-bringing-across

ha
ath
»

Klme
emlk
the-king

Mgu
ugm
and-moreover

iyx
chtzi
half-of

Mo
om
people-of

larwi
ishral
Israel

41 eneu
uene
and-behold !

lk
kl
all-of

wia
aish
man-of

larwi
ishral
Israel

Miab
baim
ones-coming

la
al
to

Klme
emlk
the-king

urmaiu
uiamru
and-they-are-saying

la
al
to

Klme
emlk
the-king

And, behold, all the men
of Israel came to the king,
and said unto the king, Why
have our brethren the men
of Judah stolen thee away,
and have brought the king,
and his household, and all
David's men with him, over
Jordan?

41

oudm
mduo
for-what-reason

Kubng
gnbuk
they-stole-you

unixa
achinu
brothers-of-us

wia
aish
man-of

eduei
ieude
Judah

urboiu
uiobru
and-they-are-bringing-across

ha
ath
»

Klme
emlk
the-king

hau
uath
and »

uhib
bithu
household-of-him

ha
ath
»

Ndrie
eirdn
the-Jordan

lku
ukl
and-all-of

iwna
anshi
mortals-of

dud
dud
David

umo
omu
with-him

42 Noiu
uion
and-he-is-answering

lk
kl
all-of

wia
aish
man-of

eduei
ieude
Judah

lo
ol
on

wia
aish
man-of

larwi
ishral
Israel

ik
ki
that

burq
qrub
near

Klme
emlk
the-king

ila
ali
to-me

emlu
ulme
and-why ?

And all the men of Judah
answered the men of Israel,
Because the king [is] near of
kin to us: wherefore then be
ye angry for this matter?
have we eaten at all of the
king's [cost]? or hath he
given us any gift?

42

ez
ze
this

erx
chre
he-is-hot

Kl
lk
to-you

lo
ol
on

rbde
edbr
the-matter

eze
eze
the-this

lukae
eakul
to-eat ?

unlka
aklnu
we-ate

Nm
mn
from

Klme
emlk
the-king

Ma
am
or

hawn
nshath
load

awn
nsha
he-carried

unl
lnu
for-us

43 Noiu
uion
and-he-is-answering

wia
aish
man-of

larwi
ishral
Israel

ha
ath
»

wia
aish
man-of

eduei
ieude
Judah

rmaiu
uiamr
and-he-is-saying

rwo
oshr
ten-

hudi
iduth
-fold

il
l i
to-me

Klmb
bmlk
in-king

And the men of Israel
answered the men of Judah,
and said, We have ten parts
in the king, and we have
also more [right] in David
than ye: why then did ye
despise us, that our advice
should not be first had in
bringing back our king? And
the words of the men of
Judah were fiercer than the
words of the men of Israel.

43

Mgu
ugm
and-moreover

dudb
bdud
in-David

ina
ani
I

Kmm
mmk
from-you

oudmu
umduo
and-for-what-reaon

inhlqe
eqlthni
you-slight-me

alu
ula
and-not

eie
eie
he-was

irbd
dbri
word-of-me

Nuwar
rashun
first

il
l i
to-me

biwel
leshib
to-bring-back

ha
ath
»

iklm
mlki
king-of-me

wqiu
uiqsh
and-he-is-being-obstinate

rbd
dbr
word-of

wia
aish
man-of

eduei
ieude
Judah

rbdm
mdbr
from-word-of

wia
aish
man-of

larwi
ishral
Israel
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