
     

1 ieiu
uiei
and-he-is-becoming

rbd
dbr
word-of

euei
ieue
Yahweh

ila
ali
to-me

rmal
lamr
to-say

. Again the word of the
LORD came unto me,
saying,

1

2 Nb
bn
son-of

Mda
adm
human

rbd
dbr
speak !

la
al
to

inb
bni
sons-of

Kmo
omk
people-of-you

hrmau
uamrth
and-you-say

Meila
aliem
to-them

Yra
artz
land

ik
ki
that

aiba
abia
I-shall-bring

eilo
olie
on-her

Son of man, speak to the
children of thy people, and
say unto them, When I bring
the sword upon a land, i f
the people of the land take
a man of their coasts, and
set him for their watchman:

2

brx
chrb
sword

uxqlu
ulqchu
and-they-take

Mo
om
people-of

Yrae
eartz
the-land

wia
aish
man

dxa
achd
one

Meiyqm
mqtziem
wakeful-ones-of-them

unhnu
unthnu
and-they-give

uha
athu
him

Mel
lem
for-them

epyl
ltzphe
for-watchman

3 earu
urae
and-he-sees

ha
ath
»

brxe
echrb
the-sword

eab
bae
coming

lo
ol
over

Yrae
eartz
the-land

oqhu
uthqo
and-he-blows

rpuwb
bshuphr
in-trumpet

riezeu
uezeir
and-he-warns

ha
ath
»

Moe
eom
the-people

If when he seeth the sword
come upon the land, he
blow the trumpet, and warn
the people;

3

4 omwu
ushmo
and-he-hears

omwe
eshmo
the-one-hearing

ha
ath
»

luq
qul
sound-of

rpuwe
eshuphr
the-trumpet

alu
ula
and-not

rezn
nzer
he-is-warned

aubhu
uthbua
and-she-is-coming

brx
chrb
sword

Then whosoever heareth
the sound of the trumpet,
and taketh not warning; i f
the sword come, and take
him away, his blood shall
be upon his own head.

4

uexqhu
uthqcheu
and-she-is-taking-him

umd
dmu
blood-of-him

uwarb
brashu
in-head-of-him

eiei
ieie
he-shall-be

5 ha
ath
»

luq
qul
sound-of

rpuwe
eshuphr
the-trumpet

omw
shmo
he-heard

alu
ula
and-not

rezn
nzer
he-was-warned

umd
dmu
blood-of-him

ub
bu
in-him

eiei
ieie
he-shall-be

aueu
ueua
and-he

He heard the sound of the
trumpet, and took not
warning; his blood shall be
upon him. But he that
taketh warning shall deliver
his soul.

5

rezn
nzer
he-is-warned

uwpn
nphshu
soul-of-him

tlm
mlt
he-escapes

6 epyeu
uetzphe
and-the-watchman

ik
ki
that

eari
irae
he-is-seeing

ha
ath
»

brxe
echrb
the-sword

eab
bae
coming

alu
ula
and-not

oqh
thqo
he-blows

rpuwb
bshuphr
in-trumpet

Moeu
ueom
and-the-people

But i f the watchman see
the sword come, and blow
not the trumpet, and the
people be not warned; i f the
sword come, and take [any]
person from among them,
he is taken away in his
iniquity; but his blood will I
require at the watchman's
hand.

6

al
la
not

rezn
nzer
he-is-warned

aubhu
uthbua
and-she-is-coming

brx
chrb
sword

xqhu
uthqch
and-she-is-taking

Mem
mem
from-them

wpn
nphsh
soul

aue
eua
he

unuob
bounu
in-depravity-of-him

xqln
nlqch
he-is-taken

umdu
udmu
and-blood-of-him

dim
mid
from-hand-of

epye
etzphe
the-watchman

wrda
adrsh
I-shall-require

7 ehau
uathe
and-you

Nb
bn
son-of

Mda
adm
human

epy
tzphe
watchman

Kihhn
nththik
I-gave-you

hibl
lbith
to-house-of

larwi
ishral
Israel

homwu
ushmoth
and-you-hear

ipm
mphi
from-mouth-of-me

rbd
dbr
word

So thou, O son of man, I
have set thee a watchman
unto the house of Israel;
therefore thou shalt hear the
word at my mouth, and warn
them from me.

7

hrezeu
uezerth
and-you-warn

Mha
athm
them

inmm
mmni
from-me

8 irmab
bamri
in-to-say-me

owrl
lrsho
to-wicked-one

owr
rsho
wicked-one

hum
muth
to-die

humh
thmuth
you-shall-die

alu
ula
and-not

hrbd
dbrth
you-speak

riezel
lezeir
to-warn

owr
rsho
wicked-one

When I say unto the
wicked, O wicked [man],
thou shalt surely die; i f thou
dost not speak to warn the
wicked from his way, that
wicked [man] shall die in his
iniquity; but his blood will I
require at thine hand.

8

ukrdm
mdrku
from-way-of-him

aue
eua
he

owr
rsho
wicked-one

unuob
bounu
in-depravity-of-him

humi
imuth
he-shall-die

umdu
udmu
and-blood-of-him

Kdim
midk
from-hand-of-you

wqba
abqsh
I-shall-seek

9 ehau
uathe
and-you

ik
ki
that

hreze
ezerth
you-warn

owr
rsho
wicked-one

ukrdm
mdrku
from-way-of-him

buwl
lshub
to-turn-back

enmm
mmne
from-her

alu
ula
and-not

bw
shb
he-turns-back

Nevertheless, i f thou warn
the wicked of his way to turn
from it; i f he do not turn
from his way, he shall die in

9
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his iniquity; but thou hast
delivered thy soul.

ukrdm
mdrku
from-way-of-him

aue
eua
he

unuob
bounu
in-depravity-of-him

humi
imuth
he-shall-die

ehau
uathe
and-you

Kwpn
nphshk
soul-of-you

hlye
etzlth
you-rescue

10 ehau
uathe
and-you

Nb
bn
son-of

Mda
adm
human

rma
amr
say !

la
al
to

hib
bith
house-of

larwi
ishral
Israel

Nk
kn
so

Mhrma
amrthm
you-say

rmal
lamr
to-say

ik
ki
that

uniowp
phshoinu
transgressions-of-us

. Therefore, O thou son
of man, speak unto the
house of Israel; Thus ye
speak, saying, If our
transgressions and our sins
[be] upon us, and we pine
away in them, how should
we then live?

10

unihatxu
uchtathinu
and-sins-of-us

unilo
olinu
on-us

Mbu
ubm
and-in-them

unxna
anchnu
we

Miqmn
nmqim
ones-being-putrefied

Kiau
uaik
and-how ?

eixn
nchie
we-shall-live

11 rma
amr
say !

Meila
aliem
to-them

ix
chi
alive

ina
ani
I

Man
nam
averment-of

inda
adni
Lord-of-me

euei
ieue
Yahweh

Ma
am
if

Ypxa
achphtz
I-am-delighting

humb
bmuth
in-death-of

Say unto them, [As] I
live, saith the Lord GOD, I
have no pleasure in the
death of the wicked; but that
the wicked turn from his way
and live: turn ye, turn ye
from your evil ways; for why
will ye die, O house of
Israel?

11

owre
ersho
the-wicked-one

ik
ki
but

Ma
am
rather

buwb
bshub
in-to-return

owr
rsho
wicked-one

ukrdm
mdrku
from-way-of-him

eixu
uchie
and-he-lives

ubuw
shubu
turn-back !

ubuw
shubu
turn-back !

Mkikrdm
mdrkikm
from-ways-of-you

Miore
eroim
the-evil-ones

emlu
ulme
and-why ?

uhumh
thmuthu
you-shall-die

hib
bith
house-of

larwi
ishral
Israel

12 ehau
uathe
and-you

Nb
bn
son-of

Mda
adm
human

rma
amr
say !

la
al
to

inb
bni
sons-of

Kmo
omk
people-of-you

hqdy
tzdqth
righteousness-of

qidye
etzdiq
the-righteous-one

al
la
not

Therefore, thou son of
man, say unto the children
of thy people, The
righteousness of the
righteous shall not deliver
him in the day of his
transgression: as for the
wickedness of the wicked, he
shall not fall thereby in the
day that he turneth from his
wickedness; neither shall the
righteous be able to live for
his [righteousness] in the
day that he sinneth.

12

unliyh
thtzilnu
she-shall-rescue-him

Muib
bium
in-day-of

uowp
phshou
transgression-of-him

howru
urshoth
and-wickedness-of

owre
ersho
the-wicked-one

al
la
not

lwki
ikshl
he-shall-stumble

eb
be
in-her

Muib
bium
in-day

ubuw
shubu
to-turn-back-him

uowrm
mrshou
from-wickedness-of-him

qidyu
utzdiq
and-righteous-one

al
la
not

lkui
iukl
he-is-able

huixl
lchiuth
to-live

eb
be
in-her

Muib
bium
in-day-of

uhatx
chtathu
sin-of-him

13 irmab
bamri
in-to-say-me

qidyl
ltzdiq
to-righteous-one

eix
chie
to-live

eixi
ichie
he-shall-live

aueu
ueua
and-he

xtb
btch
he-trusts

lo
ol
on

uhqdy
tzdqthu
righteousness-of-him

ewou
uoshe
and-he-does

When I shall say to the
righteous, [that] he shall
surely live; i f he trust to his
own righteousness, and
commit iniquity, all his
righteousnesses shall not be
remembered; but for his
iniquity that he hath
committed, he shall die for
it.

13

luo
oul
iniquity

lk
kl
all-of

uhqdy
tzdqthu
righteousness-of-him

al
la
not

enrkzh
thzkrne
they-shall-be-remembered

uluobu
uboulu
and-in-iniquity-of-him

rwa
ashr
which

ewo
oshe
he-does

ub
bu
in-him

humi
imuth
he-shall-die

14 irmabu
ubamri
and-in-to-say-me

owrl
lrsho
to-wicked-one

hum
muth
to-die

humh
thmuth
you-shall-die

bwu
ushb
and-he-turns-back

uhatxm
mchtathu
from-sin-of-him

ewou
uoshe
and-he-does

Again, when I say unto
the wicked, Thou shalt
surely die; i f he turn from his
sin, and do that which is
lawful and right;

14

tpwm
mshpht
judgment

eqdyu
utzdqe
and-justice

15 lbx
chbl
pledge

biwi
ishib
he-is-restoring

owr
rsho
wicked-one

elzg
gzle
pillage

Mlwi
ishlm
he-is-repaying

huqxb
bchquth
in-statutes-of

Miixe
echiim
the-living-ones

Kle
elk
he-goes

ihlbl
lblthi
to-avoid

[If] the wicked restore the
pledge, give again that he
had robbed, walk in the
statutes of life, without
committing iniquity; he
shall surely live, he shall not
die.

15

huwo
oshuth
to-do

luo
oul
iniquity

uix
chiu
to-live

eixi
ichie
he-shall-live

al
la
not

humi
imuth
he-shall-die

16 lk
kl
all-of

uhatx
chtathu
sins-of-him

rwa
ashr
which

atx
chta
he-sinned

al
la
not

enrkzh
thzkrne
they-shall-be-remembered

ul
lu
to-him

tpwm
mshpht
judgment

eqdyu
utzdqe
and-justice

ewo
oshe
he-does

None of his sins that he
hath committed shall be
mentioned unto him: he
hath done that which is

16
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lawful and right; he shall
surely live.

uix
chiu
to-live

eixi
ichie
he-shall-live

17 urmau
uamru
and-they-say

inb
bni
sons-of

Kmo
omk
people-of-you

al
la
not

Nkhi
ithkn
he-is-regular

Krd
drk
way-of

inda
adni
Lord-of-me

emeu
ueme
and-they

Mkrd
drkm
way-of-them

al
la
not

Yet the children of thy
people say, The way of the
Lord is not equal: but as for
them, their way is not equal.

17

Nkhi
ithkn
he-is-regular

18 buwb
bshub
in-to-turn-back

qidy
tzdiq
righteous-one

uhqdym
mtzdqthu
from-righteousness-of-him

ewou
uoshe
and-he-does

luo
oul
iniquity

hmu
umth
and-he-dies

Meb
bem
in-them

When the righteous
turneth from his
righteousness, and
committeth iniquity, he
shall even die thereby.

18

19 buwbu
ubshub
and-in-to-turn-back

owr
rsho
wicked-one

uhowrm
mrshothu
from-wickedness-of-him

ewou
uoshe
and-he-does

tpwm
mshpht
judgment

eqdyu
utzdqe
and-justice

Meilo
oliem
on-them

aue
eua
he

But i f the wicked turn
from his wickedness, and do
that which is lawful and
right, he shall live thereby.

19

eixi
ichie
he-shall-live

20 Mhrmau
uamrthm
and-you-say

al
la
not

Nkhi
ithkn
he-is-regular

Krd
drk
way-of

inda
adni
Lord-of-me

wia
aish
man

uikrdk
kdrkiu
as-ways-of-him

tupwa
ashphut
I-shall-judge

Mkha
athkm
you

hib
bith
house-of

Yet ye say, The way of
the Lord is not equal. O ye
house of Israel, I will judge
you every one after his
ways.

20

larwi
ishral
Israel

21 ieiu
uiei
and-he-is-becoming

ihwb
bshthi
in-two

erwo
oshre
ten

enw
shne
year

irwob
boshri
in-tenth

ewmxb
bchmshe
in-five

wdxl
lchdsh
to-month

unhulgl
lgluthnu
to-deportation-of-us

ab
ba
he-comes

. And i t came to pass in
the twelfth year of our
captivity, in the tenth
[month], in the fifth [day] of
the month, [that] one that
had escaped out of
Jerusalem came unto me,
saying, The city is smitten.

21

ila
ali
to-me

tilpe
ephlit
the-one-delivered

Mlwurim
mirushlm
from-Jerusalem

rmal
lamr
to-say

ehke
ekthe
she-is-smitten

rioe
eoir
the-city

22 diu
uid
and-hand-of

euei
ieue
Yahweh

ehie
eithe
she-became

ila
ali
to-me

brob
borb
in-evening

inpl
lphni
before

aub
bua
to-come

tilpe
ephlit
the-one-delivered

xhpiu
uiphthch
and-he-is-opening

Now the hand of the
LORD was upon me in the
evening, afore he that was
escaped came; and had
opened my mouth, until he
came to me in the morning;
and my mouth was opened,
and I was no more dumb.

22

ha
ath
»

ip
phi
mouth-of-me

do
od
till

aub
bua
to-come

ila
ali
to-me

rqbb
bbqr
in-morning

xhpiu
uiphthch
and-he-is-being-opened

ip
phi
mouth-of-me

alu
ula
and-not

ihmlan
nalmthi
I-am-mute

duo
oud
further

23 ieiu
uiei
and-he-is-becoming

rbd
dbr
word-of

euei
ieue
Yahweh

ila
ali
to-me

rmal
lamr
to-say

Then the word of the
LORD came unto me,
saying,

23

24 Nb
bn
son-of

Mda
adm
human

ibwi
ishbi
ones-dwelling-of

hubrxe
echrbuth
the-deserted-places

elae
eale
the-these

lo
ol
on

hmda
admth
ground-of

larwi
ishral
Israel

Mirma
amrim
ones-saying

rmal
lamr
to-say

Son of man, they that
inhabit those wastes of the
land of Israel speak, saying,
Abraham was one, and he
inherited the land: but we
[are] many; the land is
given us for inheritance.

24

dxa
achd
one

eie
eie
he-was

Merba
abrem
Abraham

wriiu
uiirsh
and-he-is-tenanting

ha
ath
»

Yrae
eartz
the-land

unxnau
uanchnu
and-we

Mibr
rbim
many-ones

unl
lnu
to-us

enhn
nthne
she-is-given

Yrae
eartz
the-land

ewruml
lmurshe
for-tenancy

25 Nkl
lkn
therefore

rma
amr
say !

Meila
aliem
to-them

ek
ke
thus

rma
amr
he-says

inda
adni
Lord-of-me

euei
ieue
Yahweh

lo
ol
on

Mde
edm
the-blood

ulkah
thaklu
you-are-eating

Mkniou
uoinkm
and-eye-of-you

Wherefore say unto them,
Thus saith the Lord GOD;
Ye eat with the blood, and
lift up your eyes toward your
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Ezechiel 33BHS  :  Transliteration  /  CHES         av



idols, and shed blood: and
shall ye possess the land?

uawh
thshau
you-are-lifting

la
al
to

Mkilulg
glulikm
ordure-idols-of-you

Mdu
udm
and-blood

ukpwh
thshphku
you-are-shedding

Yraeu
ueartz
and-the-land

uwrih
thirshu
you-shall-tenant

26 Mhdmo
omdthm
you-stand

lo
ol
on

Mkbrx
chrbkm
sword-of-you

Nhiwo
oshithn
you-do

ebouh
thuobe
abhorrence

wiau
uaish
and-man

ha
ath
»

hwa
ashth
woman-of

ueor
roeu
associate-of-him

Mhamt
tmathm
you-defile

Ye stand upon your
sword, ye work abomination,
and ye defile every one his
neighbour's wife: and shall
ye possess the land?

26

Yraeu
ueartz
and-the-land

uwrih
thirshu
you-shall-tenant

27 ek
ke
thus

rmah
thamr
you-shall-say

Mela
alem
to-them

ek
ke
thus

rma
amr
he-says

inda
adni
Lord-of-me

euei
ieue
Yahweh

ix
chi
alive

ina
ani
I

Ma
am
if

al
la
not

rwa
ashr
who

Say thou thus unto them,
Thus saith the Lord GOD;
[As] I live, surely they that
[are] in the wastes shall fall
by the sword, and him that
[is] in the open field will I
give to the beasts to be
devoured, and they that [be]
in the forts and in the caves
shall die of the pestilence.

27

hubrxb
bchrbuth
in-deserted-places

brxb
bchrb
in-sword

ulpi
iphlu
they-shall-fall

rwau
uashr
and-who

lo
ol
on

inp
phni
face-of

edwe
eshde
the-field

eixl
lchie
to-animal

uihhn
nththiu
I-give-him

ulkal
laklu
to-devour-him

rwau
uashr
and-who

hudymb
bmtzduth
in-fastnesses

hurombu
ubmoruth
and-in-caves

rbdb
bdbr
in-plague

uhumi
imuthu
they-shall-die

28 ihhnu
unththi
and-I-give

ha
ath
»

Yrae
eartz
the-land

emmw
shmme
desolation

emwmu
umshme
and-desolation

hbwnu
unshbth
and-she-ceases

Nuag
gaun
pomp-of

ezo
oze
strength-of-her

For I will lay the land
most desolate, and the
pomp of her strength shall
cease; and the mountains of
Israel shall be desolate, that
none shall pass through.

28

ummwu
ushmmu
and-they-become -desolate

ire
eri
mountains-of

larwi
ishral
Israel

Niam
main
with-no

rbuo
oubr
one-passing

29 uodiu
uidou
and-they-shall-know

ik
ki
that

ina
ani
I

euei
ieue
Yahweh

ihhb
bththi
in-to-give-me

ha
ath
»

Yrae
eartz
the-land

emmw
shmme
desolation

emwmu
umshme
and-desolation

lo
ol
on

lk
kl
all-of

Then shall they know that
I [am] the LORD, when I
have laid the land most
desolate because of all their
abominations which they
have committed.

29

Mhbouh
thuobthm
abhorrences-of-them

rwa
ashr
which

uwo
oshu
they-do

30 ehau
uathe
and-you

Nb
bn
son-of

Mda
adm
human

inb
bni
sons-of

Kmo
omk
people-of-you

Mirbdne
endbrim
the-ones-speaking

Kb
bk
in-you

lya
atzl
beside

huriqe
eqiruth
the-sidewalls

. Also, thou son of man,
the children of thy people
still are talking against thee
by the walls and in the
doors of the houses, and
speak one to another, every
one to his brother, saying,
Come, I pray you, and hear
what is the word that
cometh forth from the
LORD.

30

ixhpbu
ubphthchi
and-in-portals-of

Mihbe
ebthim
the-houses

rbdu
udbr
and-he-speaks

dx
chd
one

ha
ath
with

dxa
achd
one

wia
aish
man

ha
ath
with

uixa
achiu
brother-of-him

rmal
lamr
to-say

uab
bau
come !

an
na
please !

uomwu
ushmou
and-hear !

em
me
what ?

rbde
edbr
the-word

ayuie
eiutza
the-one-coming-forth

ham
math
from

euei
ieue
Yahweh

31 uaubiu
uibuau
and-they-shall-come

Kila
alik
to-you

aubmk
kmbua
as-coming-of

Mo
om
people

ubwiu
uishbu
and-they-are-sitting

Kinpl
lphnik
before-you

imo
omi
people-of-me

And they come unto thee
as the people cometh, and
they sit before thee [as] my
people, and they hear thy
words, but they will not do
them: for with their mouth
they shew much love, [but]
their heart goeth after their
covetousness.

31

uomwu
ushmou
and-they-hear

ha
ath
»

Kirbd
dbrik
words-of-you

Mhuau
uauthm
and-them

al
la
not

uwoi
ioshu
they-shall-do

ik
ki
that

Mibgo
ogbim
dotings

Meipb
bphiem
in-mouth-of-them

eme
eme
they

Miwo
oshim
ones-doing

irxa
achri
after

Moyb
btzom
gain-of-them

Mbl
lbm
heart-of-them

Kle
elk
going

32 Kneu
uenk
and-behold-you !

Mel
lem
to-them

riwk
kshir
as-song-of

Mibgo
ogbim
dotings

epi
iphe
lovely-of

luq
qul
voice

btmu
umtb
and-doing-well

Ngn
ngn
to-play

uomwu
ushmou
and-they-hear

ha
ath
»

And, lo, thou [art] unto
them as a very lovely song
of one that hath a pleasant
voice, and can play well on
an instrument: for they hear
thy words, but they do them
not.

32

Kirbd
dbrik
words-of-you

Miwou
uoshim
and-ones-doing

Mnia
ainm
there -is-no-them

Mhua
authm
them
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33 eabbu
ubbae
and-in-to-come-her

ene
ene
behold !

eab
bae
coming

uodiu
uidou
and-they-shall-know

ik
ki
that

aibn
nbia
prophet

eie
eie
he-became

Mkuhb
bthukm
in-midst-of-them

And when this cometh to
pass, (lo, i t will come,) then
shall they know that a
prophet hath been among
them.
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