
     

1 uxlw
shlchu
send !

rk
kr
butting-lamb

lwm
mshl
ruler-of

Yra
artz
land

olsm
mslo
from-crag

erbdm
mdbre
toward-wilderness

la
al
to

re
er
mountain-of

hb
bth
daughter-of

Nuiy
tziun
Zion

. Send ye the lamb to the
ruler of the land from Sela
to the wilderness, unto the
mount of the daughter of
Zion.

1

2 eieu
ueie
and-he-becomes

Puok
kouph
as-flyer-of

ddun
nudd
flitting

Nq
qn
nest

xlwm
mshlch
being-sent

eniieh
theiine
they-are-becoming

hunb
bnuth
daughters-of

baum
muab
Moab

hrbom
mobrth
crossings

For i t shall be, [that], as a
wandering bird cast out of
the nest, [so] the daughters
of Moab shall be at the
fords of Arnon.

2

Nunral
larnun
to-Arnon

3 uaibe
ebiau
bring !

eyo
otze
counsel

uwo
oshu
make !

elilp
phlile
mediation

ihiw
shithi
set !

lilk
klil
as-night

Kly
tzlk
shadow-of-you

Kuhb
bthuk
in-midst-of

Mirey
tzerim
noons

irhs
sthri
conceal !

Take counsel, execute
judgment; make thy shadow
as the night in the midst of
the noonday; hide the
outcasts; bewray not him
that wandereth.

3

Mixdn
ndchim
ones-being-expelled

ddn
ndd
one-flittering

la
al
must-not-be

ilgh
thgli
you-are-exposing

4 urugi
iguru
they-shall-sojourn

Kb
bk
in-you

ixdn
ndchi
ones-being-expelled-of

baum
muab
Moab

iue
eui
be !

rhs
sthr
concealment

uml
lmu
for-them

inpm
mphni
from-face-of

Let mine outcasts dwell
with thee, Moab; be thou a
covert to them from the face
of the spoiler: for the
extortioner is at an end, the
spoiler ceaseth, the
oppressors are consumed
out of the land.

4

dduw
shudd
devastator

ik
ki
that

spa
aphs
he-limits

Yme
emtz
the-squeezer

elk
kle
he-finishes

dw
shd
devastation

umh
thmu
they-come-to-end

smr
rms
tramping

Nm
mn
from

Yrae
eartz
the-land

5 Nkueu
ueukn
and-he-shall-be-established

dsxb
bchsd
in-kindness

ask
ksa
throne

bwiu
uishb
and-he-sits

uilo
oliu
on-him

hmab
bamth
in-truth

leab
bael
in-tent-of

dud
dud
David

tpw
shpht
judge

And in mercy shall the
throne be established: and
he shall sit upon i t in truth
in the tabernacle of David,
judging, and seeking
judgment, and hasting
righteousness.

5

wrdu
udrsh
and-he-inquires

tpwm
mshpht
judgment

remu
umer
and-he-is-swift

qdy
tzdq
righteousness

6 unomw
shmonu
we-hear

Nuag
gaun
pomp-of

baum
muab
Moab

ag
ga
proud

dam
mad
exceedingly

uhuag
gauthu
pride-of-him

unuagu
ugaunu
and-pomp-of-him

uhrbou
uobrthu
and-rage-of-him

al
la
not

Nk
kn
so

. We have heard of the
pride of Moab; [he is] very
proud: [even] of his
haughtiness, and his pride,
and his wrath: [but] his lies
[shall] not [be] so.

6

uidb
bdiu
pretenses-of-him

7 Nkl
lkn
therefore

lilii
i i l i l
he-shall-howl

baum
muab
Moab

bauml
lmuab
for-Moab

elk
kle
all-of-her

lilii
i i l i l
he-shall-howl

iwiwal
lashishi
to-raisins-of

riq
qir
sidewall-of

hwrx
chrshth
Harosheth

Therefore shall Moab
howl for Moab, every one
shall howl: for the
foundations of Kirhareseth
shall ye mourn; surely [they
are] stricken.

7

ugeh
thegu
you-shall-soliloquize

Ka
ak
yea

Miakn
nkaim
ones-being-sore

8 ik
ki
that

humdw
shdmuth
plantations-of

Nubwx
chshbun
Heshbon

llma
amll
he-is-enfeebled

Npg
gphn
vine-of

embw
shbme
Sibmah

ilob
boli
possessors-of

Miug
guim
nations

umle
elmu
they-hammerd-down

For the fields of Heshbon
languish, [and] the vine of
Sibmah: the lords of the
heathen have broken down
the principal plants thereof,
they are come [even] unto
Jazer, they wandered
[through] the wilderness: her
branches are stretched out,
they are gone over the sea.

8

eiqurw
shruqie
vines-of-her (LXX)

do
od
unto

rzoi
iozr
Jazer

uogn
ngou
they-touch

uoh
thou
they-stray

rbdm
mdbr
wilderness

eihuxlw
shlchuthie
runners-of-her

uwtn
ntshu
they-are-let-go

urbo
obru
they-pass

Mi
im
sea

9 lo
ol
on

Nk
kn
so

ekba
abke
I-shall-lament

ikbb
bbki
in-lamentation-of

rzoi
iozr
Jazer

Npg
gphn
vine-of

embw
shbme
Sibmah

Kuira
ariuk
I-shall-soak-you

ihomd
dmothi
tears-of-me

Nubwx
chshbun
Heshbon

Therefore I will bewail
with the weeping of Jazer
the vine of Sibmah: I will
water thee with my tears, O
Heshbon, and Elealeh: for
the shouting for thy summer
fruits and for thy harvest is
fallen.

9

elolau
ualole
and-Elealeh

ik
ki
that

lo
ol
on

Kyiq
qitzk
summer-of-you

lou
uol
and-on

Kriyq
qtzirk
harvest-of-you

ddie
eidd
whooping

lpn
nphl
he-falls

10 Psanu
unasph
and-he-is-gathered

exmw
shmche
rejoicing

ligu
ugil
and-exultation

Nm
mn
from

lmrke
ekrml
the-crop

Mimrkbu
ubkrmim
and-in-vineyards

al
la
not

Nnri
irnn
he-is-jubilating

al
la
not

And gladness is taken
away, and joy out of the
plentiful field; and in the
vineyards there shall be no

10
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singing, neither shall there
be shouting: the treaders
shall tread out no wine in
[their] presses; I have made
[their vintage] shouting to
cease.

oori
iroo
he-is-shouting

Nii
i in
wine

Mibqib
biqbim
in-wine-vats

al
la
not

Krdi
idrk
he-is-treading

Krde
edrk
the-treader

ddie
eidd
whooping

ihbwe
eshbthi
I-cause-to-cease

11 lo
ol
on

Nk
kn
so

iom
moi
bowels-of-me

bauml
lmuab
for-Moab

runkk
kknur
as-harp

umei
iemu
they-are-clamoring

ibrqu
uqrbi
and-inwards-of-me

riql
lqir
for-side-wall-of

wrx
chrsh
Haresh

Wherefore my bowels
shall sound like an harp for
Moab, and mine inward
parts for Kirharesh.

11

12 eieu
ueie
and-he-becomes

ik
ki
that

earn
nrae
he-appears

ik
ki
that

ealn
nlae
he-is-tired

baum
muab
Moab

lo
ol
on

embe
ebme
the-fane-height

abu
uba
and-he-comes

la
al
to

And it shall come to pass,
when it is seen that Moab is
weary on the high place,
that he shall come to his
sanctuary to pray; but he
shall not prevail.

12

uwdqm
mqdshu
sanctuary-of-him

llphel
lethphll
to-pray

alu
ula
and-not

lkui
iukl
he-shall-prevail

13 ez
ze
this

rbde
edbr
the-word

rwa
ashr
which

rbd
dbr
he-spoke

euei
ieue
Yahweh

la
al
to

baum
muab
Moab

zam
maz
from-then

This [is] the word that the
LORD hath spoken
concerning Moab since that
time.

13

14 ehou
uothe
and-now

rbd
dbr
he-speaks

euei
ieue
Yahweh

rmal
lamr
to-say

wlwb
bshlsh
in-three-of

Minw
shnim
years

inwk
kshni
as-years-of

rikw
shkir
hireling

elqnu
unqle
and-he-is-made-light-off

But now the LORD hath
spoken, saying, Within three
years, as the years of an
hireling, and the glory of
Moab shall be contemned,
with all that great multitude;
and the remnant [shall be]
very small [and] feeble.

14

dubk
kbud
glory-of

baum
muab
Moab

lkb
bkl
in-all

Numee
eemun
the-throng

bre
erb
the-many

rawu
ushar
and-remnant

tom
mot
little

rozm
mzor
bit

aul
lua
not

ribk
kbir
abundant
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