
     

1 ek
ke
thus

rma
amr
he-says

euei
ieue
Yahweh

uxiwml
lmshichu
to-anointed-of-him

wrukl
lkursh
to-Cyrus

rwa
ashr
whom

ihqzxe
echzqthi
I-hold-fast

unimib
biminu
in-right-hand-of-him

drl
lrd
to-sway

. Thus saith the LORD to
his anointed, to Cyrus,
whose right hand I have
holden, to subdue nations
before him; and I will loose
the loins of kings, to open
before him the two leaved
gates; and the gates shall
not be shut;

1

uinpl
lphniu
before-him

Miug
guim
nations

inhmu
umthni
and-waists-of

Miklm
mlkim
kings

xhpa
aphthch
I-shall-unloose

xhpl
lphthch
to-open

uinpl
lphniu
before-him

Mihld
dlthim
doors

Mirowu
ushorim
and-gates

al
la
not

urgsi
isgru
they-shall-be-closed

2 ina
ani
I

Kinpl
lphnik
before-you

Kla
alk
I-shall-go

Mirudeu
uedurim
and-honors

rwua
aushr
I-shall-level

huhld
dlthuth
doors-of

ewuxn
nchushe
copper

rbwa
ashbr
I-shall-break

ixirbu
ubrichi
and-bars-of

lzrb
brzl
iron

I will go before thee, and
make the crooked places
straight: I will break in
pieces the gates of brass,
and cut in sunder the bars of
iron:

2

odga
agdo
I-shall-hew-down

3 ihhnu
unththi
and-I-give

Kl
lk
to-you

huryua
autzruth
treasures-of

Kwx
chshk
darkness

inmtmu
umtmni
and-ones-buried-of

Mirhsm
msthrim
concealments

Noml
lmon
in-order-to

odh
thdo
you-shall-know

ik
ki
that

And I will give thee the
treasures of darkness, and
hidden riches of secret
places, that thou mayest
know that I, the LORD,
which call [thee] by thy
name, [am] the God of
Israel.

3

ina
ani
I

euei
ieue
Yahweh

aruqe
equra
the-one-calling

Kmwb
bshmk
in-name-of-you

iela
alei
Elohim-of

larwi
ishral
Israel

4 Noml
lmon
on-account-of

idbo
obdi
servant-of-me

bqoi
ioqb
Jacob

larwiu
uishral
and-Israel

irixb
bchiri
chosen-one-of-me

arqau
uaqra
and-I-am-calling

Kl
lk
to-you

Kmwb
bshmk
in-name-of-you

For Jacob my servant's
sake, and Israel mine elect,
I have even called thee by
thy name: I have surnamed
thee, though thou hast not
known me.

4

Knka
aknk
I-am-titling-you

alu
ula
and-not

inhodi
idothni
you-know-me

5 ina
ani
I

euei
ieue
Yahweh

Niau
uain
and-there -is-no

duo
oud
further

ihluz
zulthi
except-me

Nia
ain
there -is-no

Miela
aleim
Elohim

Krzaa
aazrk
I-am-belting-you

alu
ula
and-not

. I [am] the LORD, and
[there is] none else, [there
is] no God beside me: I
girded thee, though thou
hast not known me:

5

inhodi
idothni
you-know-me

6 Noml
lmon
in-order-to

uodi
idou
they-shall-know

xrzmm
mmzrch
from-rising-of

wmw
shmsh
sun

ebrommu
ummorbe
and-from-west

ik
ki
that

spa
aphs
he-limits

idolb
blodi
apart-from-me

ina
ani
I

euei
ieue
Yahweh

That they may know from
the rising of the sun, and
from the west, that [there is]
none beside me. I [am] the
LORD, and [there is] none
else.

6

Niau
uain
and-there -is-no

duo
oud
further

7 ryui
iutzr
one-forming

rua
aur
light

arubu
ubura
and-one-creating

Kwx
chshk
darkness

ewo
oshe
one-making

Mulw
shlum
welfare

arubu
ubura
and-one-creating

or
ro
evil

ina
ani
I

euei
ieue
Yahweh

I form the light, and create
darkness: I make peace, and
create evil: I the LORD do
all these [things].

7

ewo
oshe
one-doing

lk
kl
all-of

ela
ale
these

8 upiore
eroiphu
drip !

Mimw
shmim
heavens

lomm
mmol
from-above

Miqxwu
ushchqim
and-skies

ulzi
izlu
they-are-distilling

qdy
tzdq
righteousness

xhph
thphthch
she-shall-open

Yra
artz
earth

Drop down, ye heavens,
from above, and let the
skies pour down
righteousness: let the earth
open, and let them bring
forth salvation, and let
righteousness spring up
together; I the LORD have
created it.

8

urpiu
uiphru
and-they-shall-be-fruitful

owi
isho
salvation

eqdyu
utzdqe
and-righteousness

ximyh
thtzmich
she-shall-sprout

dxi
ichd
together

ina
ani
I

euei
ieue
Yahweh

uiharb
brathiu
I-create-him

9 iue
eui
woe !

br
rb
one-contending

ha
ath
with

uryi
itzru
One-forming-him

wrx
chrsh
earthenware

ha
ath
with

iwrx
chrshi
artificers-of

emda
adme
ground

rmaie
eiamr
he-is-saying ?

rmx
chmr
clay

Woe unto him that striveth
with his Maker! [Let] the
potsherd [strive] with the
potsherds of the earth. Shall

9
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the clay say to him that
fashioneth it, What makest
thou? or thy work, He hath
no hands?

uryil
litzru
to-one-forming-him

em
me
what ?

ewoh
thoshe
you-are-making

Klopu
upholk
and-contrivance-of-you

Nia
ain
there -is-no

Midi
idim
hands

ul
lu
to-him

10 iue
eui
woe !

rma
amr
one-saying

bal
lab
to-father

em
me
what ?

diluh
thulid
you-are-generating

ewalu
ulashe
and-to-woman

em
me
what ?

Nilixh
thchilin
you-are-travailing

Woe unto him that saith
unto [his] father, What
begettest thou? or to the
woman, What hast thou
brought forth?

10

11 ek
ke
thus

rma
amr
he-says

euei
ieue
Yahweh

wudq
qdush
Holy-One-of

larwi
ishral
Israel

uryiu
uitzru
and-one-forming-him

huihae
eathiuth
the-things-arriving

inulaw
shaluni
ask-me !

lo
ol
on

. Thus saith the LORD,
the Holy One of Israel, and
his Maker, Ask me of things
to come concerning my
sons, and concerning the
work of my hands command
ye me.

11

inb
bni
sons-of-me

lou
uol
and-on

lop
phol
contrivance-of

idi
idi
hand-of-me

inuyh
thtzuni
you-are-instructing-me

12 ikna
anki
I

ihiwo
oshithi
I-made

Yra
artz
earth

Mdau
uadm
and-human

eilo
olie
on-her

iharb
brathi
I-created

ina
ani
I

idi
idi
hands-of-me

utn
ntu
they-stretched-out

Mimw
shmim
heavens

I have made the earth,
and created man upon it: I,
[even] my hands, have
stretched out the heavens,
and all their host have I
commanded.

12

lku
ukl
and-all-of

Maby
tzbam
host-of-them

ihiuy
tzuithi
I-instruct

13 ikna
anki
I

uehrioe
eoirtheu
I-rouse-him

qdyb
btzdq
in-righteousness

lku
ukl
and-all-of

uikrd
drkiu
ways-of-him

rwia
aishr
I-am-straightening

aue
eua
he

enbi
ibne
he-shall-build

I have raised him up in
righteousness, and I will
direct all his ways: he shall
build my city, and he shall
let go my captives, not for
price nor reward, saith the
LORD of hosts.

13

irio
oiri
city-of-me

ihulgu
ugluthi
and-deportation-of-me

xlwi
ishlch
he-shall-send

al
la
not

rixmb
bmchir
in-price

alu
ula
and-not

dxwb
bshchd
in-bribe

rma
amr
he-says

euei
ieue
Yahweh-of

huaby
tzbauth
hosts

14 ek
ke
thus

rma
amr
he-says

euei
ieue
Yahweh

oigi
igio
labor-of

Mirym
mtzrim
Egypt

rxsu
uschr
and-merchandise-of

wuk
kush
Cush

Miabsu
usbaim
and-Sabeans

iwna
anshi
mortals-of

edm
mde
measure

Thus saith the LORD,
The labour of Egypt, and
merchandise of Ethiopia
and of the Sabeans, men of
stature, shall come over
unto thee, and they shall be
thine: they shall come after
thee; in chains they shall
come over, and they shall
fall down unto thee, they
shall make supplication
unto thee, [saying], Surely
God [is] in thee; and [there
is] none else, [there is] no
God.

14

Kilo
olik
on-you

urboi
iobru
they-shall-pass

Klu
ulk
and-to-you

uiei
ieiu
they-shall-become

Kirxa
achrik
after-you

ukli
ilku
they-shall-go

Miqzb
bzqim
in-manacles

urboi
iobru
they-shall-pass

Kilau
ualik
and-to-you

uuxhwi
ishthchuu
they-shall-prostrate

Kila
alik
to-you

ullphi
ithphllu
they-shall-pray

Ka
ak
yea

Kb
bk
in-you

la
al
El

Niau
uain
and-there -is-no

duo
oud
further

spa
aphs
limit-of

Miela
aleim
Elohim

15 Nka
akn
surely

eha
athe
you

la
al
El

rhhsm
msththr
one-concealing-yourself

iela
alei
Elohim-of

larwi
ishral
Israel

oiwum
mushio
one-saving

Verily thou [art] a God
that hidest thyself, O God of
Israel, the Saviour.

15

16 uwub
bushu
they-are-ashamed

Mgu
ugm
and-moreover

umlkn
nklmu
they-are-confounded

Mlk
klm
all-of-them

udxi
ichdu
together

ukle
elku
they-go

emlkb
bklme
in-confounding

They shall be ashamed,
and also confounded, all of
them: they shall go to
confusion together [that are]
makers of idols.

16

iwrx
chrshi
artificers-of

Miriy
tzirim
forms

17 larwi
ishral
Israel

owun
nusho
he-is-saved

eueib
bieue
in-Yahweh

houwh
thshuoth
salvation-of

Mimluo
oulmim
eons

al
la
not

uwbh
thbshu
you-shall-be-ashamed

alu
ula
and-not

[But] Israel shall be saved
in the LORD with an
everlasting salvation: ye
shall not be ashamed nor
confounded world without
end.

17

umlkh
thklmu
you-shall-be-confounded

do
od
unto

imluo
oulmi
eons-of

do
od
future

18 ik
ki
that

ek
ke
thus

rma
amr
he-says

euei
ieue
Yahweh

arub
bura
one-creating

Mimwe
eshmim
the-heavens

aue
eua
he

Mielae
ealeim
the-Elohim

ryi
itzr
one-forming

Yrae
eartz
the-earth

For thus saith the LORD
that created the heavens;
God himself that formed the
earth and made it; he hath
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established it, he created i t
not in vain, he formed it to
be inhabited: I [am] the
LORD; and [there is] none
else.

ewou
uoshe
and-one-making-her

aue
eua
he

ennuk
kunne
he-established-her

al
la
not

ueh
theu
chaos

earb
brae
he-created-her

hbwl
lshbth
to-dwell

eryi
itzre
he-formed-her

ina
ani
I

euei
ieue
Yahweh

Niau
uain
and-there -is-no

duo
oud
further

19 al
la
not

rhsb
bsthr
in-concealment

ihrbd
dbrthi
I-speak

Muqmb
bmqum
in-place-of

Yra
artz
earth

Kwx
chshk
being-dark

al
la
not

ihrma
amrthi
I-said

orzl
lzro
to-seed-of

bqoi
ioqb
Jacob

ueh
theu
chaos

I have not spoken in
secret, in a dark place of the
earth: I said not unto the
seed of Jacob, Seek ye me
in vain: I the LORD speak
righteousness, I declare
things that are right.

19

inuwqb
bqshuni
seek-me !

ina
ani
I

euei
ieue
Yahweh

rbd
dbr
one-speaking

qdy
tzdq
righteousness

digm
mgid
one-telling

Mirwim
mishrim
upright-things

20 uybqe
eqbtzu
convene !

uabu
ubau
and-come !

uwgnhe
ethngshu
close-yourselves !

udxi
ichdu
together

itilp
phliti
delivered-ones-of

Miuge
eguim
the-nations

al
la
not

uodi
idou
they-know

. Assemble yourselves
and come; draw near
together, ye [that are]
escaped of the nations: they
have no knowledge that set
up the wood of their graven
image, and pray unto a god
[that] cannot save.

20

Miawne
enshaim
the-ones-carrying

ha
ath
»

Yo
otz
wood

Mlsp
phslm
carving-of-them

Millphmu
umthphllim
and-ones-praying

la
al
to

la
al
El

al
la
not

oiwui
iushio
he-is-saving

21 udige
egidu
tell !

uwigeu
uegishu
and-bring-close !

Pa
aph
indeed !

uyoui
iuotzu
they-shall-consult

udxi
ichdu
together

im
mi
who ?

oimwe
eshmio
he-announced

haz
zath
this

Mdqm
mqdm
from-afore time

Tell ye, and bring [them]
near; yea, let them take
counsel together: who hath
declared this from ancient
time? [who] hath told i t from
that time? [have] not I the
LORD? and [there is] no
God else beside me; a just
God and a Saviour; [there
is] none beside me.

21

zam
maz
hitherto

edige
egide
he-told-her

aule
elua
not ?

ina
ani
I

euei
ieue
Yahweh

Niau
uain
and-there -is-no

duo
oud
further

Miela
aleim
Elohim

idolbm
mblodi
apart-from-me

la
al
El

qidy
tzdiq
righteous

oiwumu
umushio
and-one-saving

Nia
ain
there -is-no

ihluz
zulthi
except-me

22 unp
phnu
face-about !

ila
ali
to-me

uowueu
ueushou
and-be-saved !

lk
kl
all-of

ispa
aphsi
limits-of

Yra
artz
earth

ik
ki
that

ina
ani
I

la
al
El

Niau
uain
and-there -is-no

duo
oud
further

Look unto me, and be ye
saved, all the ends of the
earth: for I [am] God, and
[there is] none else.

22

23 ib
bi
in-me

ihobwn
nshbothi
I-swear

ayi
itza
he-is-faring-forth

ipm
mphi
from-mouth-of-me

eqdy
tzdqe
righteousness

rbd
dbr
word

alu
ula
and-not

buwi
ishub
he-shall-be-recalled

ik
ki
that

I have sworn by myself,
the word is gone out of my
mouth [in] righteousness,
and shall not return, That
unto me every knee shall
bow, every tongue shall
swear.

23

il
l i
to-me

orkh
thkro
she-shall-bow

lk
kl
every-of

Krb
brk
knee

obwh
thshbo
she-shall-swear

lk
kl
every-of

Nuwl
lshun
tongue

24 Ka
ak
yea

eueib
bieue
in-Yahweh

il
l i
to-me

rma
amr
he-says

huqdy
tzdquth
righteousnesses

zou
uoz
and-strength

uido
odiu
unto-him

aubi
ibua
he-shall-come

Surely, shall [one] say, in
the LORD have I
righteousness and strength:
[even] to him shall [men]
come; and all that are
incensed against him shall
be ashamed.

24

uwbiu
uibshu
and-they-shall-be-ashamed

lk
kl
all-of

Mirxne
enchrim
the-ones-being-hot

ub
bu
in-him

25 eueib
bieue
in-Yahweh

uqdyi
itzdqu
they-shall-be-just

ullehiu
uithellu
and-they-shall-praise

lk
kl
all-of

orz
zro
seed-of

larwi
ishral
Israel

In the LORD shall all the
seed of Israel be justified,
and shall glory.
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